10.

11.

12.

13.

OCONEE COUNTY COUNCIL MEETING
TUESDAY, JULY 16, 1996
3:00 PM
Call to Order
Invocation

Approval of Minutes of Regular Meeting Held June
18, 1996

Approval of Minutes of Special Meeting Held July 5,
1996

Discussion Regarding the Sheriff's Department
Overseeing Second Shift Dispatch for the City of
Walhalla - Mayor Ken Johns

Consideration of Request for Funds to Re-Advertise
for a Part Time Clerk in the Tax Collector's Office
- Mrs. Mona Towe, Delinquent Tax Collector

Consideration of Request to Apply for State Budget
& Control Board Grant for Sewer Line to Service
Industrial Site - Mr. Robert ¢Gaillard, Economic
Development Director & Mr. Robert Winchester, Sewer
Commission Superintendent

Consideration of Request for Contingency Funds for
Architect for Health Department - Mr. Bob Craig,
District Administrator

Consideration of Request to Purchase Back-up Tape
Recorder for Communications - Mr. Steve Pruitt,
Chief Deputy & Mr. Buddy Hawk, 911 Coordinator

Discussion Regarding Location of Manned Convenience
Center in Ebenezer Community - Mr. Steve Blackwell
& Other Concerned Citizens

Consideration of Renewal of Auditing of County
Records for Fiscal Year 1996-97 - Ms. Marianne
Dillard, Purchasing Agent

Consideration of Renewal of Wrecker Service for
Oconee County - Ms. Marianne Dillard, Purchasing
Agent & Mr. Lee Davis, Motor Pool Foreman

Consideration of Bids for Body Repair to Patrol Car
- Mr. Lee Davis, Motor Pool Foreman & Ms. Marianne
Dillard, Purchasing Agent
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14.

15.

l6.

17v.

i8.

19.

20.
21.

22.

Consideration of Bids for Repairs to 980C CAT Wheel
Loader - Mr. Lee Davis, Motor Poocl Foreman, Mr.
Tommy Crumpton, Rock Crusher Director & Ms.
Marianne Dillard, Purchasing Agent

Consideration of Bids for Replacing Track Rails for
Fiat Allis Loader - Mr. Lee Davis, Motor Pool
Foreman, Mr. Jack Hirst, Solid Waste Director & Ms.
Marianne Dillard, Purchasing Agent

Consideration of Bids for Forklift - Mr. Jack
Hirst, Solid Waste Director & Ms. Marianne Dillard,
Purchasing Agent

Consideration of Bids for Cover Dirt for Seneca
Landfill - Mr. Jack Hirst, Solid Waste Director &
Ms. Marianne Dillard, Purchasing Agent

Discussion Regarding Air Conditioning System at ‘

Courthouse - Mr. Jim Smith, Director, Public
Buildings
Approval of Resolution 96-34, "A  RESOLUTION

AUTHORIZING THE FIRST INTEREST PAYMENT DATE TO BE
MARCH 1, 1997 WITH RESPECT TO THE $2,800,000 OCONEE
COUNTY, SOUTH CAROLINA GENERAL OBLIGATION BONDS,
SERIES 1996 HERETOFORE AUTHORIZED BY AN ORDINANCE
ADOPTED BY THE COUNTY COUNCIL ON JUNE 4, 1996 AND
OTHER MATTERS WITH RESPECT THERETO"

0ld Business
New Business

Adjourn

*%%]1:00 pm*** Roads & Transportation Committee Meeting in
Council Chambers for the purpose of making a field trip to
review roadway problems.



MEMBERS, OCCONEE COUNTY COUNCIL

Ms. M. Fran Burrell, District I Mr. Harrison E. Orr, Disti
Mr. Harry R. Hamilton, District III Mr. Roy B. Strickland, P
Mr. Alton K. Williams, District V

MINUTES, OCONEE COUNTY COUNCIL MEETING

The regular meeting of the Oconee County
Council was held Tuesday, July 16, 1996 at 3:00 pm in Council
Chambers with all Council Members (Mr. Strickland came in at 3:1¢9
pm) and the County Attorney present.

Members of the press notified (by mail):
Journal/Tribune, Keowee Courier, Westminster News, Anderson
Independent, Greenville News, WGOG Radio, WBFM Radio, WCCP
Radio, WYFF TV & WLOS TV.

Members of the press present: Ashton Hester <
Keowee Courier, Greqg Oliver - Journal/Tribune & Terry Cregar -
Anderson Independent.

The meeting was called to order by Super-
visor-Chairman Crain who welcomed the guests and media.

The invocation was given by Mr. Orr.

Mr. Williams made a motion, seconded by Ms.
Burrell, approved 4 - 0 (Mr. Strickland not present) that the
minutes of the regular meeting held June 18, 1996 be adopted as
printed.

Mr. Williams made a motion, seconded by Mr.
Orr, approved 3 - 0 (Mr. Strickland not present, Ms. Burrell
abstaining) that the minutes of the special meeting held July 5,
1996 be adopted as printed.

Mr. Ken Johns, Mayor, City of Walhalla,
addressed Council regarding the Sheriff's Department overseeing
dispatch for Walhalla on the second shift. Mr. Johns informed
Council they had asked for this service since 1989 and they did
not feel they, as county citizens, were getting what they paid
for.

Mr. Johns further informed Council he did not
feel the convenience center in the Ebenezer Community was in a
good location, the City of Walhalla had plenty of room and they
would be willing to have one inside the city limits.

Mr. Steve Pruitt, Chief Deputy, responded to
Mr. Johns' request by informing Council if the Sheriff's Depart-
ment had received the city's request before the budgets were
submitted they could have asked for additional dispatchers to
handle second shift calls for Walhalla. The Sheriff's Department

is presently handling dispatch for the city on the third shift a#

well as checking tags and licenses for them.

rict II
istrict IV

Press

call to
Order

Invocation

Minutes
(6/18/96)

Minutes
{(7/5/96)

City of
Walhalla
Request
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Mr. Pruitt also informed Council that it
might be possible for the Sheriff's Department to handle
dispatch on the second shift for the City of Walhalla after the
new dispatchers are trained.

Mr. Cain, County Attorney, informed Council
that the Sheriff is a duly elected constitutional officer and
they have no jurisdiction to dictate what he will or will not doj;

The request of Mrs. Mona Towe, Delinquent
Tax Collector to re-advertise for a Part Time Account Clerk I
position was denied upon motion by Ms. Burrell, seconded by Mr.
Strickland, approved 5 - 0.

Upon request of Mr. Steve Pruitt, Chief
Deputy, and Mr. Buddy Hawk, 911 Coordinator, Mr. Strickland made
a motion, seconded by Mr. Williams, approved 4 - 0 (Mr. Orr
acting as Chairman, Mr. Crain temporarily out of room) that a
back up tape recorder for Communications be purchased using a
portion of the $.48 tariff that is charged to phone customers
each month. The cost of the equipment is approximately $25,000.

Mr. Steve Blackwell addressed Council
regarding the site of the manned convenience center in the
Ebenezer Community. Mr. Blackwell stated his concerns were:

(1) Inappropriate location
(2) Ineffectiveness of location

(3) Ill sited, low usage will occur or
there will be danger from adequate
usage

(4) There is no logic in the green boxes it
replaces

(5) The site is contrary to the
recommendations of the leaders of
Walhalla & West Union

Mr. Blackwell further recommended that
construction be stopped, the situation be re-evaluated and the
site be remediated.

Mr. Mike Evatt stated a site on Highway 188
would be a more ideal location.

After further discussion, Council informed
them they had tried to secure several sites other than the one
that was chosen, but they were unsuitable or unavailable.

Request
Cont'd

Tax
Collector

Dispatch
Equipment

80lid waste
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At this time Supervisor-Chairman Crain had
to leave the meeting and Vice Chairman Orr presided over the
remainder of the meeting.

Upon recommendation of Ms. Marianne Dillard,
Purchasing Agent, Mr, Williams made a motion, seconded by Mr.
Hamilton, approved 4 - 0 (Mr. Orr acting as Chairman) that the
bid with Byerley & Payne, P.A. and Kirk S. Messick, P.A. for
auditing services for fiscal year 1996-97 be renewed at a cost
of $24,245. (See attached letter)

Upon recommendation of Mr. Lee Davis, Motor
Pool Foreman, & Ms. Marianne Dillard, Purchasing Director, Mr.
Strickland made a motion, seconded by Mr. Hamilton, approved 4 -
0 (Mr. Orr acting as Chairman) that the bid for wrecker service
for the county be renewed for six (6) months until January 10,
1997 with Carter Wrecking Company. (See attachment)

Also upon recommendation of Mr. Davis & Ms.
Dillard, Mr. Williams made a motion, seconded by Ms. Burrell,
approved 4 - 0 (Mr. Orr acting as Chairman) that the bid for
repairing the wrecked patrol car be awarded to Owens Automotive
who was low bid at a cost of $6,094. (See attached bid sheet)

Upon recommendation of Mr. Tommy Crumptoen,
Rock Crusher Director, Mr. Lee Davis, Motor Pool Foreman, and
Ms. Marianne Dillard, Purchasing Agent, Mr. Strickland made a
motion, seconded by Mr. Hamilton, approved 4 - 0 (Mr. Orr
acting as Chairman) that the bid for repairing the 980C Cat
Wheel Loader be awarded to Blanchard Machinery, Co. who was the
only bid at a cost of $120,202. (See attached bid sheet)

Upon recommendation of Mr. Jack Hirst, Solid
Waste Director, Mr. Davis and Ms. Dillard, Mr. Williams made a
motion, seconded by Mr. Strickland, approved 4 - 0 (Mr. Orr
acting as Chairman) that the bid for replacing the track rails on
the Fiat-Allis be awarded to Boggs Tractor Company, Inc. who was
low bid at $19,479. (See attached bid sheet)

Upon request of Mr. Hirst, Mr. Strickland
made a motion, seconded by Mr. Hamilton, approved 4 -~ 0 (Mr. Orr
acting as Chairman) that $63,000 be transferred from line item
016 049 00150 04932 into line item 016 049 00150 00840 for the
purchase of nine (92) roll off containers, a fork 1lift and a
tractor/mower for the Materials Recovery Facility with the
understanding these funds will be replaced through the lease/
purchase program.

Crain Left
Meeting

Auditing

Motor
Pool
Wrecker
Service

Sheriff's
Vehicle
Repair

980C Cat

Repair

8o0lid
Waste
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Upon recommendation of Mr. Hirst and Ms.
Dillard, Mr. Hamilton made a motion, seconded by Mr. Strickland,
approved 4 - 0 (Mr. Orr acting as Chairman) that the bid for a
forklift for Solid Waste be awarded to Yale-Dougherty Equipment
Company, Inc. who was low bid at a cost of $19,818.65. (See
attached bid sheet)

Also upon recommendation of Mr. Hirst and
Ms. Dillard, Mr. Strickland made a motion, seconded by Mr.
Williams, approved 4 - 0 (Mr. Orr acting as Chairman) that the
bid for cover dirt for Seneca Landfill be awarded to Harris
Farms & Construction who was low bid at a cost of $2.17 per
cubic yard. (See attached bid sheet)

Mr. Strickland made a motion, seconded by
Mr. Hamilton, approved 4 - 0 (Mr. Orr acting as Chairman) that
Mr. Buddy HawK negotiate the cost of cover dirt to close the
Seneca Landfill under Subtitle "D" regqulations.

Mr. Hamilton made a motion, seconded by Ms.
Burrell, approved 4 - 0 (Mr. Orr acting as Chairman) that
Resclution 96-34, "A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE FIRST INTEREST
PAYMENT DATE TO BE MARCH 1, 1997 WITH RESPECT TO THE $2,800,000
OCONEE COUNTY, SOUTH CAROLINA GENERAL OBLIGATION BONDS, SERIES
1996 HERETOFORE AUTHORIZED BY AN ORDINANCE ADOPTED BY THE COUNTY
COUNCIL ON JUNE 4, 1996 AND OTHER MATTERS WITH RESPECT THERETO"
be adopted on first and final reading.

Mr. Hamilton informed Council that he had
not been able to schedule a meeting with the property owners
regarding a right-of-way on Deerwood Lane.

Mr. Hamilton further informed Council that
Mr. Dirk Reis with the SC Appalachian Council of Governments
had assured him the county was pursuing the right channels to
get something done regarding the bridge on Radio Station Road.
However, there is a long waiting list for such grants and it
could be several years before that bridge could be corrected by
grant. :

Mr. Strickland made a motion, seconded by
Mr, Williams, approved 4 - 0 {(Mr. Orr acting as Chairman) that
Mr. Michael Bond be extended credit at the Rock Crusher as per
Ordinance 91-10, "AN ORDINANCE TO PROVIDE FOR THE SALE OF _
SURPLUS STONE, GRAVEL, AND LIKE PRODUCTS BY OCONEE COUNTY AND
TO PRESCRIBE THE MANNER OF SUCH SALES AND THE PAYMENT AND
ACCOUNTING THEREFOR, AND TO REPEAL ORDINANCE 78-8 AS AMENDED
BY ORDINANCE 79-12".

Forklift

Cover Dirt

Res. 96-34

Deerwood
Lane

Bridge

Credit
at Rock
crusher
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Upon recommendation of Mr. Buddy Hawk, Right
-of-Way Technician, Mr. Strickland made a motion, seconded by Mr
Hamilton, approved 4 - 0 (Mr. Orr acting as Chairman) that
portions of the following roadways be abandoned back to the land
owners:

Galloway Road (WH 10)

Ables Road (SE 284)

Johnson Cove Road (WA 28)
Double Branch Road (SE 74)
Gobbler's Knob Drive (CH 88)

Alsc that a portion of Bottoms Drive (WA 254)
be abandoned contingent upon consensus of the land owners below
the relocation of the roadway.

Ms. Burrell made a motion, seconded by Mr.
Hamilton, approved 4 - 0 (Mr. Orr acting as Chairman) that
Resolutions 96-30 through 96-33 be adopted and the honorees be
invited to the August 6, 1996 Council Meeting to be presented
these resolutions.

Mr. Orr, Chairman, Roads & Transportation
Committee, informed Council it was the recommendation of the
committee that Mr. Hawk determine if Santee Drive gualifies
for county maintenance as a non subdivision.

Further the committee is recommending that
the county seek rights-of-ways on both sides of TU 104 to place
a culvert to alleviate a water problem on that roadway.

Both these recommendations were adopted 4 -
0 (Mr. Orr acting as Chairman).

Upon request of Mr. Kenneth F. Williams,
County Auditor, and recommendation of Mr. Timothy M. Cain,
County Attorney, Mr. Strickland made a motion, seconded by Ms.
Burrell, approved 4 - 0 (Mr. Orr acting as Chairman) that
$790.08 be taken from contingency and placed in line item 010
021 00150 24304 to correct a billing error of twenty-eight (28)
mills rather than the approved thirty (30) mills in taxes which
should have been collected for the Town of Salem for the tax
year ending December 31, 1995 contingent upon the county making
no admission of liability and obtaining a release from the Town
of Salem.

Mr. Cain alsc informed Council that the
county owns a portion of what Mt. Nebo uses as a parking lot at
the church, they are interested in purchasing this property, the
church needs to have a plat made of the property, it is his
opinion that the county does not need this property, however,
the SC Department of Commerce, Division of Aeronautics and the

Roads

Res. 96-30
- 96-33

Roads

Auditor
(Cont'cy)

Airport
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Federal Aviation Administration would have to confirm that the
county does not need the property.

Mr. Cain also informed Council a meeting
with the City of Seneca is being scheduled to discuss the Seneca
Landfill.

He further informed Council that the county
would be closing on the purchase of the twenty-one (21) acres
adjacent to the Rock Crusher Thursday, July 18, 1996.

Adijourn: 5:30 pm

Submitted By:

Qo © vae.

Opal O. Green
Council Clerk

Reviewed By:

Norman D. Crain

Supervisor-Chairman
&

Harrison E. Orr

Vice Chairman

Oconee County Counci|]

Airport
Con'd

Landfill

Rock
Crusher

Adjourn



"OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

Matling:
. 208 Booker Diive 201 West Main Stacet
Qllathalla, B0 20691 Wabhallo, SC 29691

June 28, 1996

Punchasing Agent
Marianne A. Ditlord

Byerley & Payne, P.A.

Kirk S. Messick, P. A.

Certified Public Accountant, P.A.
Attn: Mark A. Payne, CPA

114 W. N. First Street

Seneca, SC 29679

RE: Auditing
Bid 94-44
Dear Mr. Payne:

The purpose of this letter is to see if you agree to renewat of the above
referenced bid. The amount of the alternate for fisal year 96-97 is $25,245.00.

. The final renewal to be considered on this bid will be for fiscal year 97-98.
If you agree to this renewal, please sign below and return to Purchasing
Department.
Sincerely,
Marianne Dillard
Purchasing Agent

I agree to renewal of the above referenced bid.

Dellephone
(864) 638 - 4141

Tax
(864) 638 - 4142




OCONEE COUNTY MOTOR POOL

HELEN JACKSON Telephone {803) 638-4145
PARTS MAMAGER Fax (803) 638-4142
208 BOOKER DRIVE

WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

June 07, 1996

Cartee Wrecking Company
Attn: R. C. Cartee

Post Office Box 247

Seneca, South Carolina 2967%

RE: Bid 95-26

The current bid for wrecker service for Oconee County expires on July 10, 1996. The bid
was written with the option to renew for two additional six month periods. If you would
like to renew this bid until January 10, 1997 please sign below and return to Oconee
County Motor Pool. Thank you very much.

Sincerely,

Medp O} Qesaon

Helen A. Jackson
Parts Manager

/hj

Cartee Wrecking Company agrees to extend Bid #95-26 for an additional six month
period untit January 10, 1997,

‘ b~/3-2¢

Date

Authorize Signature



Jine 13,%96

Bid Tabulation Sheet - Q Repair to Patrol Car

BIDDER Owens Automotive Henry's Body Shop Galbreath Auto Paint Shop
—

Part & Repairs $ 4588211% 5,072.70 no bid

Labor 1,287.00 1,254,00

Sales Tax 218.79 253.83

Grand Total $ / 6,094.00 | $ 6,580.33

Attended Bid Opening: Marianne Dillard, Jenny Peay, Lee Davis - Oconee County

BIDTAB7.XLS

oo @s.so
Walhalla, SC 29691



BID NO.95-4¢%

Use this number

on envelopes and

all related correspondence))

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W. MAIN STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The
submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in
corapliance with the description(s) and/or specification(s) attached for body repair to 1994
- Ford Crown Victoria patrol car,

COST
1ea. Parts & Repairs $HSER I
Labor (4.9  bours@$ 2000 ) 't‘lazf] oo
: &
Sales Tax : &13,”3
E(for"“
TOTAL ! $LHR >

*"i‘
5 ad.:{H‘:e.; |

i
i

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.

Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental
Form attached hereto.

Delivery Date:

Bidding Organization: (" M ayo & Budzroerrhive

Address: Hwiy ] St P Brax 208 \nlesd- Hn'm,sgf, 29310

Signature of Bidders Representative: \3‘5.7 7 M

Title: S Lone Date: /p~ S ~9Q(n
Telephone: (Rl (23R8 8




BID NO.95-49

Use this number

on envelopes and

all related correspondence,)

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W. MAIN STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The
submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in
compliance with the description(s) and/or specification(s) attached for body repair to 1994
- Ford Crown Victoria patrol car,

COST
s072.79
1ea. Parts & Repairs $ LE8F G~
23 ?—
Labor ( : ! hours @ $ ?73::003 ) / 254 00
Sales Tax 25 i ég

TOTAL $ éi XQEZ .

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.

Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental
Form attached hereto.

Delivery Date:

Bidding Organization: #—MW;/A B o) %;ﬂ

Address: () alla S 2965/
Signature of Bidders Representative: J//P/K/M/ A/;Z/}Mv

mite:___ (D)o Date: é/ o / &l

Telephone: 21; Y - (033-’ ‘??7 /




‘ .

Bid No.85-51
Walhalla, SC 29691

T

June 25, 1996 Bid Tabulation - Repairs to 980C Cat Wheel Loader
Road Machinery Blanchard
BIDDER Services, Inc. Van Lott, Inc. Machinery Co.
Caterpillar Parts Only:
Qverhaul engine no bid no bid 22,338.00
Overhaul transmission 15,682.00
Final drive - rebearing & reseal 20,400.00
Differential - rebearing & reseal - front 1,873.00
- rear 1,902.00 |.
Center pins - replace all articulation pins 1,326.00
Brakes - rebuild brake system - 4 wheels 6,5628.00
Bottom bucket pins 1,643.00
Hydraulic system/steering 28,356.00
Paint/repaint & redecal entire machine 5,304.00
VVINng & gauges - repair (if necessary)
NOT TO EXCEED - 5,610.00
Freight 2,000.00
Radiator - replace 6,120.00
Freon compressor 1.0éd.00
Total 120,202.00
Delivery 90 days
Option #1 - Alternate Parts no bid no bid no bid

BIDTABS.XLS

Attended Bid Opening: Jenny Peay, Ann Albertson, Lee Davis, Tommy Crumpton - Oconee County, Scott Forrester - Blanchard Machinery



BID NO. 95-51

{Use this number on envelopes and
all reiated correspondence.)

BID FORM ()
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W. MAIN STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

. The _ROAD MACHINERY SERVICES, INC.
submlts herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in compliance with the

description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for repairs to 980C Caterpillar Wheel
Loader
Overhaul engine 3
Overhaul transmission 3
Finai drive - rebearing & reseal $
Differential - rebearing & reseal - front | $
- Tear $
Center pins - replace all articulation pins $
Brakes - rebuild brake system - all 4 wheels 3
Bottom bucket pins $
Hydraulic system/steering $
Paint/repaint & redecal entire machine $
Wiring & gauges - repair (if necessary) NOT TO EXCEED §
TOTAL ' $ NOQ BID

Bid shall inclunde delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.
Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental
Form attached hereto.

Delivery Date: Time needed to complete

Bidding Organization;  ROAD MACHINERY SERVICES, INC,
Address: P.O. BOX 5392, STATESVILLE, NC 28687
Signature of Bidders Representative: D

Titlee CORPORATE SECRETARY Date: JUNE 21. 1996
Telephone:  (704) 872-9528




n llll 116 CORPORATE DRIVE
® Simpsonville, S.C. 29681

Construction Machinery Phone (864) 963-5835

6/17/96

Oconee County Purchasing Dept.
208 Booker Dr.
Walhalla, SC 29691

RE: BID NO. 95-51
Repairs to 980C Caterpillar Wheel Loader

To Whom It May Concern:

At this time, we respectfully decline a bid on the above
subject 980C Caterpillar Wheel Loader. We would appreciate
congideration on any future bids for repairing of your
industrial equipment.

Sincerely,

Dyl Ve

William Prather
Service Manager




BID NO. 9551
(Use this number on envelopes sad
all related correspondentce.) '

BID FORM
- OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT ¢
201 W. MAIN-STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The 6{th\am Ylochine R Co
submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request sumber shown above, nd in compliance with the

description(s) snd/or specification(s) attached hereto for: - repairs to 980C Cuterpillar Whee!
Logder .

IS

. W{M . Ff-aul.‘ng C!\aeges f 2“,922.'

u.ul- Aegeur e

merﬁmnﬁmmmm -  —". v Y 7
Final drive - rebearing & reseal S J0, Heo.
Differentia] - rebearing & reseal - front S [ G723
- T8ar ' ) L, 902
Center pins - replace all srticulation pins $ [ 324
Brakes - rebuild breke system - all 4 wheels s _(54%
Bottom bucket pins s (043
Hydraulic systenvsteering s 23, 35L.
Paint/repaint & redecal entire machine(nc Sand blasﬂnj s 5304
Wiring & gsuges » rqmr (if necessary) NOT TO EXCEED § 5 6[0
TOTAL . $ [A0, A0

Bid shall include dehvetyto location stated on Bid Notice,
Show sny exception, devistion, extrs computition, orinformmon on Bid Supplemental
mechedhmo B w}ﬂf "

s
Delivery Date:ox Phc‘ersﬁtm 4-1 9, Time needed to complete __ /0 ﬁ%

Bidding Organization: A Janchaed l/YlacJunmg (b,
Address: _315] Clorfesdod mhia £-C 997

Signature of Bidders Representative: <
Title: ' (/ Date: (o

Telepbone: 3D 3- 9[- 7/00




BIDNO. 95-51
(Use this sumber on snvelopes and
.., Sl related correspondeace.)

submits herewi:h our Bidin response to bid request numb:r shown above, and fn camplinnce with the
dmﬂpmn(i) and/or specification(s) sttached hereto for ~ repairs to 980C Caterpillar Whecl

Overhaul transmission
Final drive - rebearing & reseal

Differential - rebearing & reseal - front
' - v

Center pins - replace all articulation pins
Brakes - rebuild brake system - all 4 wheds
Bottom bucket pm.s

M A A NN W A

Pmepaht & fedecﬂl mﬁ*‘mchm ; ; *;‘. “ ‘_‘ Lo
Wiring & geuges - repair (3 nmssary) NOT TO EXCEBD s
g L ' ___NL_EE.’_;A__W\ OP'\';M:H"

Bid shall include dalivery to location stated on Bid Notice,
Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental
Form attached hereto. . . .

Telephone 803 ‘79 ’)/oo
L e e ima s oot
. ol l!j'-;", SR




BID smrmmu FORM
OCONEE conm mcmsme nngwmr

301 WEST MAIN STREXT
WALBALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

DATE: __Sune 25 194 BDNO. A5-5)\

The b&:e&b}ﬁé M&‘a_c_bingra[ Q%P:’%l takes the following exceptions(or exp\'an’a#ior\\;
(Biddar)

» Our o\uo"(-v\-,an B SHuUMes ?"\\-a'\‘ we will recaive vyour machine in a2 runnia
and aper'ab\e. S"’Lv -:.onc\ Mon 5 +\\era¢are., we did At m:..\uke_ 'M\Y ma_:\or
C-a"v‘\'wg: Csué\n 1 b\or-\f-. “ernkshebt, camehaft, heads , ©f Fransmission c,-aSQ
in our grice, We al\so 3ssume hat m\o_rn-a\ cn:_:,ne.. and  drive train
parke are cse.numg_ Coster .l\ar‘ F\'S 3 A\ non- C—-:’\‘#.rpu\\'al‘ p'ar-\-s. would b
‘o be raf\'ac.e& and 'aésén-‘non-a\ G}\"ﬁ& would rasuly, Our aa“"&"ﬁch does 4
ineinde he rep\'ad.emc.ﬂ'\' ol 20y m:%-r% ?”""s. No maching n%\ 1% mc\u&ec\

"El" b a&\'a)fnf' re “"5- s ’[ vureL o ne WA
o—g\gice.r:-f + e_ ée el p:nt.. E:A p-ns, ouyr aluo - .on ae;. ni
holee,, We <ould nol provide =

m:..\uk boﬁ or r"wor\“' c:.a‘;.*—\-kti epecificakions
o véa:cf‘r%m\slbgrm-bhe brafe smﬁg% bao_uPerarC-’ e"F"‘?""' specificstions and won

incdlude norma\  wWear r\'e.ms) items suweh 9s pivten hausmg, e (iR ﬁeaﬁeéb

would be eskra.,

© H*{Ahu\i( /er\e.critﬂ 'Sya’rem Nou\é. be +horou h\)’ '”"’ch-e& (?"’“?‘5, \('a\\fes hose
and other reladed r-\-_fb those. items which de ndt meet Cn"t‘erp.\\—;/
5?ec.-$ir_—r\'uor\$ WOu\B be rc -;.reé of re?\".\ceé - '

® f\n-.f 9??\“-7\9\3 "("ﬁie‘_. 'are. nd"' |M\uA¢A N our qud'h‘\‘.m
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SIGNATURE: ‘
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and sea\s ¢ s other parts would be @Y =dditiona) cofT,
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Bid No.96-02

Walhalla, SC 29691

July _10, 1996 Bid Tabulation - Replace Track Rails - Fiat Allis
Boggs Tractor Co. |Pioneer Machinery, |Road Machinery
SIDDER Inc. Inc. Services, Inc.
Base Bid 3 18,666.00 | $ 19,657.82 | § 20,276.86
Sales Tax 813.00 887.89 848.84
Total $ ../1 9,479.00 | $ 2054571 | § 21,125.70
Delivery 3 weeks ARO 2 weeks after as required

delivery to shop

did not bid on

22 mm bolts/holes

J

Attended Bid Opening: Jenny Peay, Ann Albertson - Oconee County, Bobby Bell - Road Machinery, Mark Anderson - Pioneer Machinery

BIDTABZ2. XLS



BID NO. %6-02
{Use this ngnber on envelopes and
all relsted correspondence.)

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W. MAIN STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The A 294 % '7/‘@974”/” & Irc
submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in
compliance with the description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for
. Parts and labor to replace tracks on Fiat Allis FL.20 Loader

Base Bid s 1Bb6y,0”
S. C. Sales Tax - 813,°°
TOTAL Bid Price s 19 ‘?‘7faw

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice,
Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental
Form attached hereto.

Delivery Date; i [hin  Thsee & ¢eks ofler order
Bidding Organization:____ B 0245 Trecloy Zo L2 e
Address: HE7 WMaul ol ere N M

Signature of Bidders Representative: WW

Title: /ﬂ 722 §% Date:

Telephone: ? 9 ?— ?‘olp ,2\




BID SUPPLEMENTAL FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 WEST MAIN STREET

WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

DATE: T-9-4& BID NO. 96-02

The g f9¢ 75 /7tl ) ’//’ é Lre takes the following exceptions:
(Bidder)

wvitk Rebuild Top fiollers D&/zc(7/¢wﬂ”".
dollurs,

SIGNATURE: ‘




BID NO. 96-02
{Use this number on envelopes and

all related correspondence.) .

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W. MAIN STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The PTONEFR MACHINERY INC.

submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in
compliance with the description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for
Paxts and labor to replace tracks on Fiat Allis F1.20 Loader

Base Bid $ 19,657.82
S. C. Sales Tax 887.89
TOTAL Bid Price | $ 20,545.71

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.
Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental
Form attached hereto..

Delivery Date: Two (2) Weeks After Receipt of Loader to our Shop

Bidding Organization: PIONEER MACHINERY INC.

Address: PO Box 1098-405 OAK ROAD-PTEDMONT, SC 29673

Signature of Bidders Representative:_ 27 . “Fa s s vicfon ev?r
Title: PARTS MANAGER - Date: ___ July 10, 1996
Telephone:  (864) 269-7995




BID NO. 96-02

(Use this number on envelopes and
all relsted correspondence.)

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W. MAIN STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The ROAD MACHINERY SERVICES, INC,
submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in
compliance with the description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for

~ Partsand laborto r n Fiat Allis F1.2 er
Base Bid $_ 2027686
S. C. Sales Tax 848.84
TOTAL Bid Price $ 21,125.70

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.
Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental
Form attached hereto. |

Delivery Date: AS REQUIRED
Bidding Organization: ROAD MACHINERY SERVICES, INC.
Address: P.O. BOX 5392, STATESVILLE, NC 28687

Signature of Bidders Representative: //)d /c‘_ Z ._;/*ZZ'

Title: MARKETING MANAGER Date: JULY 8, 1996
Telephone:_ (704) 872-9528




BID SUPPLEMENTAL FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

201 WEST MAIN STREET
WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

| 96-02
DATE: JULY 8, 1996 BID NO.
The ROAD MACHINERY SERVICES, INC. _ _takes the following exceptions:
(Bidder) o

2 REBUILT FRONT IDLER 300.00 600.00
1 LABOR TO REMOVE/REPLACE

COMPLETE UNDERCARRIAGE 1500.00
2 41' SEALED & LUBRICATED RAIL 2900.00 5800.00
82 20" DOUBLE GROUSER PAD

(WITH 22 MM BOLT HOLES) 34.50 2829.00
328 22 MM TRACK BOLTS & NUTS 2.25 738.00
8 S.F. TRACK ROLLER 370.00 2960.00
6 D.F. TRACK ROLLER 378.00 2268.00
4 TOP CARRIER ROLLERS 265.00 1060.00
2 SPROCKET SEGMENT GROUP 305.00 610.00
54 SEGMENT BOLTS & NUTS 8.09 436.86
! INTERNAL IDLER PARTS

(BEARINGS, SEALS, ETC.) 275.00
1 HAULING CHARGE (TO & FROM

OCONEE COUNTY) 1200.00

TOTAL (EXCLUDING SALES TAX) $ 20,276.86

SIGNATURE: 47/4(/ = ?"‘f;y s




.Jurt.ie 25, 1996 Bid Tabulation - 4,0001b Forkiift Bid No.95-50
Walhalla, SC 29691
Yale-Dougherty Upstate Forklift
Equipment Co., |(Wrenn Handling, |Piedmont Clarklift,|Piedmont Clarklift,| Spartan Leasing |[Maint. & Truck
BIDDER Inc. inc. Inc. #1 Inc. #2 Co., Inc. Repair, Inc.
4,000 |Ib Forklift $ 16,184.90 | § 16,618.00 | $ 17,998.00 \& 18,365.]!{) $ 19,350.00 | $ 19,680.00
Bale Clamp Attachment 3,333.75 3,150.00 2,868.00 X ~ 2,868.00 3,000.00 3,305.00
SC Sales Tax 300.00 - 300.00 300.00 X .00 300.00 300.00
TOTAL 3 '%9,818.65 $ 20,068.00 | $ 21,166.00 | $ 533.00 | $ 22,650.00 | $ 23,285.00
Delivery 3-4weeks | 8 -9 weeks ARC Sep-96 véek of Juiy}st 6-8weeks | 3rd week of July
Brand ‘Yale Hyster Daewoo G205 Daewoo G205 Komatsu TCM
Warranty 1 year
2 add. yrs/5000
Extended Warranty hr. add $267
did not meet
specs
Attended Bid Opening: Jenny Peay, Ann Albertson - Oconee County, Scott Silver - Piedmont Clarklift,
Richard Willard - Yale-Dougherty, Randy Kelly - Wrenn Handling

BIDTABS.XLS




(=R R e

(Use this number on envelopes
and all related correspondense]

‘BID FORMp; it
= OCONEE COUNTY
E & PURCHASING ‘DEPARTMENT
201 WEST MAIN  STREET
WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29591

¥ e Oougherty Equipment Company

Zi"its. ‘herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in
GLPOA4QAF

-:liance with the description(s) and/or specification(s) numbered
Bactached hereto for 4,000 Lb. Forklift

- ¢ 16,184.90
3,333.75

4 4,000 Lb. Forklift

; E_Bqle' Clamp--:Agta_chment R R S $
8. C. Sales Tax - o $_ 300.00
' $ 19,818,65

";shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.
any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental

attached hereto.
Bivery Date: Unit With Triplex Mast - From Stock With Duplex Mast - 3-4 Wee

’_DING ORGANIZATION _Yale-Dougherty . Equipment Company, Inc.

goress: P.O. BOX P. 0, Box 3597
f[v, STATE, ZIP CODE Greenville, SC_ 29608

£NATURE OF BIDDERS REPRESENTATIVE: __R. K. Willard
TITLE: . Account Manager

£ DATE: - -Jine 241996

TE;LEFHONE.- . {800) 476-1727

.....




fj DATE: June 24, 1936

BID SUPPLEMENTAL FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 WEST MAXN STREET

WALRALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

BIDNO,  Bid # 95-50

Dougherty Equipmgn:t Company, Inc, takes the following exceptions:
(Bidder)

Pﬁicing;geod.unti]‘June.ao, 1996
Clamﬂ%ﬂapacdtymgasanﬁ1#5ﬂ$¢ﬁﬁamimgnRamge;l89-64")

*Triplex Mast 84/189", Please ADD: $675.00
*Extended Warranty (3 Years/5000 Hours), Please ADD $267.00

Capacity of truck 4000 Ibs. at 24" Load. Center
with standard-forks, down.rated with quoted attachment,
actual capacity will beé indicated on name plate.

SIGNATURE: R. K. Willard 2;\[[;(* )M




UG/ 20/ 99 V2 I OV VUV tata N .

BID NO. 95-50

(Use this number on envelopes
and all related correspondense)

' BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 WEST MAIN STREET
WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 28681

The e s //nn/i[.;wf, Tue

submrts herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in

compliance with the description(s) and/or specification{s) numbered

and artached hereto for 4,000 Lb, Forklift
4,000 Lb. Forklift $ 16.618.00
Bale Clamp Attachment $ 3,150.00
S. C. Sales Tax $ 300.00
TOTAL $ 20,068.00

Bid shall in¢lude delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.
Show any exceptlon, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental

Form attached hereto.

Delivery Date: _Fjight 1o Nine Weeks ARD
BIDDING ORGANIZATION Wrenn Handling, Inc.

ADDRESS: P.O. BOX P.0. Box 16809
CITY, STATE, 2IF CODE Greenville, SC 29606

SIGNATURE OF BIDDERS REPRESENTATIVE: A
TITLE: Sales Representative

DATE: __ June 25, 1996
TELEPHONE:  864-277-8070




BID SUPPLEMENTAL FORM

OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARYMENT
201 WEST MAIN STREET
WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

DATE: __June 25, 1996 BIDNO. __ Bid # 95-50
The Wrenn Handling, Inc. takes the following exceptions:
{Bidder)

1. VYour specifications call for 130" 1ift height.
A. Quoted 129.5" lift height.
2. Your Tally Sheet indicated a $300.00 sales tax cap.

A. Per our best information, fork lifts are not included in the
$300.00 tax cap. If the fork 1ift is used in the manufacture
of a product, it is non-taxable. If the fork lift is used as
warehousing unit only, it is subject to the existing tax rate

of the county it is delivered to.

SIGNATURE: _ Randy Kelley : i
/d"/&’




: _ BID NO. Jo=oU

(Use this number on enveiopes ’
M A iand all related correspondense)

E;ID‘.FORMi .

OCONEE COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 WEST MAIN STREET
WALLHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

The Piedmont Clark!ift, Inc.
submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in

compliance with- the descrlptlon(s) and/or specification(s) nurnbered
and attached hereto for 4,000 Lb. Forklift

4,000 Lb. Forklift T

$__17,998.00
Bale Clamp Attachment ) o $  2,868.00
S. C. Sales Tax $ 300,00
TOTAL $_ 21,166.00

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bic Notice.
Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, d_r j._i‘nformation on Bid Suppiemental

Form attached hereto , ‘s
SRSV NP &4 R

Delivery Date: ‘ 09]95

BIDDING ORGANIZATION Piedmont C1arkJ1ft. Tnic,
ADDRESS: P.O. BOX 16328

CITY, STATE, ZIF CODE \ Greenvﬂ’1e;- SC_ 29606

SIGNATURE OF BIDDERS REPRESENTATIVE: gar EL—-

TITLE: Uﬂ?zm- Manadet
DATE: __06/17/9%

TELEPHONE: (864} 29741330




/ m ' P. O. BOX 16328, I-85 AT I-385, GREENVILLE, SC 29606
. »3 GREENVILLE (864) 297-1330 SPARTANBURG (864) 585-6204
e/

PIEDMONT ECLARKLIFT, INC. FAX (864) 288-5874

To: Oconee County Purchasing Dept.r__ Date: June 17, 1996
201 West Main Street- o Quote No.: 142-96-03
Walhalla, SC 29§Q14: S, tyepp ot RPLO,B.t Delivered

Terms: Net 10 Days

{1y 5 T S
Jut oy - Lo

Attn: Ms. Marianne Dillard .. RO LTE3T

We are pleased to quote the following for your consideration:
REC i'i'ﬂ,%_,.i—,r:-

QTY DESCRIPTION

One = Daewoo Model. GZOS LP Gas Powered Lift Truck
4,000 Lbs. Basic Capacity At 24" Load Center

SPECIFICATIONS:

Lift Height - 130" Hilo Upright

Overall Height Lowered - 85"

Free Lift -~ 56"

Solid Drive & Steer Tires

Yellow & Black Paint

Single Auxiliary Valve/Hose Adaptatlon

Tilt Cyllnder

Combinatiom*

Back-Up Alarm

Strobe Light

Overhead Guard Lights

One-Extra LPG Tank

Quick Disconnects

Service Manuals

BolzoniBake v€ramp.- ;A*B}GOUtLbfﬁtapacity,-
Opening Range: 17. n - - 69. 1

R SR LA S BRI

Truck Sell PriCe...eeascssnsccscsncsssssanssssansnssesadl?,998,.00 Each
Attachment.sseseasssascensncnessserssssnncassssasansaaans 2,868,00 Each
T EKO S 4 uaasssnnstasaasssensosssessssssattnossoesanssseseah 300.00

Total PriCe.iceiecesesssssnesemnasssencssssssrsscnssseass$2l,166.00 Each

Prices quoted are those in effect at the t@me of quotation and are
for immediate acceptance. Subject to applicable taxes.

) -5.'? ‘. i ““.”, h_‘ L’. A
Salesmen: . Accqp;ed By:
. Scott Silver Pitles T T T
Area Manager ' -  Dater, D1l

SOUTH CAROLINA'S LEADING AND MOST COMPLETE “BATTERV
MATERIALS HANDLING EQUIPMENT AND SERVICE K“I {OmPANV

CLARK

EQUIPMENY




BID NO. 75-35U

(Use this number on envelopes -
and all related correspondense)

BID FORM .

OCONEE COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 WEST MAIN STREET
WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

The Piadmont Clarklift, Inc
submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in

compliance with the description(s) and/or specification{s) numbered

and attached hereto for 4,000 Lb. Forklift
4,000 Lb. Forklift % 18.365.00
Bale Clamp Attachment $ 2,868.00
S. C. Sales Tax $ 300,00
TOTAL ‘ $ 21,533.00

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on BiC Notice.

Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Suppiemental

Form attached hereto.

Defivery Date: Week Of July 1, 1996

BIDDING ORGANIZATION Piedmont Clarklift, Incg.
ADDRESS: P.O. BOX 16328

CITY, STATE, ZIF CODE Greenville, SC_ 29606

SIGNATURE OF BIDDERS REPRESENTATIVE: C;F gﬂ/ﬂ'&w
TITLE: ﬂ'm M___Aﬁez,

DATE: 06/17/96
TELEPHONE: _(864) 297-1330




@— P O.BOX 16328, -85 AT 1-385, GREENVILLE, SC 29606
' GREENVILLE (8464) 297-1330 SPARTANBURG (844) 585-6204
FAX (864) 288-5874
PIEDMONT B CLARKLIFT, INC.
To: Oconee County Purchasing Dept.- Date: June 17, 1996 .
201 West Main Street Quote No.: 141-96-03

Walhalla, SC 29691 F.0.B,: Delivered
Terms: Net 10 Days

Attn: Ms. Marianne Dillard
We are pleased to quote the following for your consideration:
QTY DESCRIPTION

One - Daewoo Model G20S LP Gas Powered Lift Truck
4,000 Lbs. Basic Capacity At 24" Load Center

SPECIFICATIONS:

Lift Height - 188" Triple Stage Upright
Overall Height Lowered - 83"
Free Lift - 62"
Carriage - 37"
Load Backrest - 48" x 37"
Forks - 42" x 4"
Sclid Pneumatic Drive & Steer Tires
Yellow & Black Paint
Drivers Overhead Guard
Single Auxiliary Valve/Hose Adaptation
One-Extra LPG Tank
Quick Disconnects
- Back-Up 'Alarm
Seat Belt
Tilt Steering; Power Steering
Two-Sets Of Service, Parts & Operating Manuals
Overhead Guard Lights, Rear Light; Stop Light
Strobe Light; Turn Signhal
Bolzoni Bale Clamp - 3,600 Lb, Capacity,
Opening Range:; 17.3" - 69.7"

Truck Sell PriCe.cscesesssssansssnacsccvenansnnnsnssssssasl8,365.00 Each
ALLACNMENE st s v esevovsevssssesnarssanscnnsancssnssenssasnsd 2,868,000 Each
PR E G e eecesornvsssssesssosnsnsntssassassens csessananssersaned 300.00

Total Price..veeeee Ceesseertres s st n ettt asastnann s $21,533.00 Each

Prices quoted are those in effect at the time of gquotation and are
for immediate acceptance. Subject to applicable taxes.

Salesmen: Q—. &HL /g"ﬂ'*”‘ - Accepted By:

. Scott silver Title:
Area Manager Date: .
Cl1ARK SOUTH CAROLINA'SLEADING AND MOSTCOMPLETE | “BRTTERY
MATERIALS HANDUNG EQUIPMENT AND SERVICE "m (OMPANY
EQUIPMENT ”




BID NO. #o-5u

(Use this number on envelopes -
and all related correspondense)

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 WEST MAIN STREET
WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 20691

The Spartan Leasing Co., Inc.

submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in

compliance with the description(s) and/or specification{s) numbered SLC - 2398

and attached hereto for 4,000 Lb. Forklift
4,000 Lb. Forklift ' $ 19,350.00
Bale Clamp Attachment $ 3,000.00
S. C. Sales Tax . $ - 300.00
TOTAL ’ $ 22,650.00

Bid shall include delivery to ipcation stated on BiZ Notice.

Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental

Faorm attached hereto.

Delivery Date: 6 = 8 weeks

BIDDING ORGANIZATION  SPARTAN LEASING CO., INC.

ADDRESS: P.O. BOX 1267 j

CITY, STATE, ZIF CODE  SPARTANBURG, SC 29304 e~ // //

SIGNATURE OF BIDDERS REPRESENTATIVE:

TITLE: Executive Vice— id
DATE: June 20, 13996

TELEPHONE: 864-576-6880

t/General Manager




DIk e

{UUse this number on enve opes
and all related correspondense; -

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 WEST MAIN STREET
WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

The Upstate Forklift Maint. and Truck Repair Inc.

submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in
compliance with the description(s) and/or specification(s) numbered 95-50
and attached hereto for 4,000 Lb. Forklift
4,000 Lb. Forklift $ 19680.00
Bale Clamp Attachment $  3305.00
S. C. Sales Tax $_ 300.00
TOTAL ‘ $ 23285.00

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bic Notice.

Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplementa!

Form attached hereto.

Delivery Date: 3rd Week of July
BIDDING ORGANIZATION _ Upstate Forklift Maint. & Truck Repair, Inc.
ADDRESS: P.O. BOX 39 Shipping:; 2425 Sandifer Blwd

CiTy, STATE, ZIF CODE  Seneca, 8C 29679

SIGNATURE OF BIDDERS REPRESENTATIVE:

TITLE: Customer Service Rep
DATE: Jutie 20, 1996 _
ELEPHONE: (864) 647.4291

=

Pase




*

Bid No.96-01
Walhalla, 5C 28691

Juiy“’10, 1996 Bid Tabulation - Caver Dirt fo Seneca Landfill
Hamis Farms & Hutch-n-Son Thrift Brothers,

BIDDER Construction Construction Inc.

Base Bid - per cubic yard $ o 2171 % 285 % 4.00

Aftended Bid Opening: Jenny Peay, Ann Alberison - Oconee

County, Carolyn Harris - Harris Farms,

Danny Hutchenson

- Huich-n-Son,

Cindy Williams - Thrift Brothers

- BIDTAB1.XLS



BIDNO. _ 96-01

Use this number envelopes and
all related correspondence.)

' BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W. MAIN STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The /Jm&:&m FAEYUs = ﬂamm‘—

submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request mﬂnber shown above, and
compliance with the description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for
30,000 - 40,000 cubic yards soil delivered to the Seneca Lan

BASE BID - per cubic yard 3 CQ i / 7

Based on 30,000-40,000 cubic yards to be purchased

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.
Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental
Form attached hereto.

Delivery Date:l}b Svaest- Iull_m/ U=-4:u£§ L. pvbe s Coaudlid da-d"nc‘/— e
- . ; /1 R ot B/1fL

Bidding Organization: /ézﬂ RrRls _FrMns 'r‘! oAEW _

Address: 63T Derc _,__f*!&c:,é, A

Signature of Bidders Representative: QQ.Z\Z ﬁ #

Title, D egale e— “ Date: 7//6/9‘5

Telephone: 972 - 3 43 (&




Use this number envelopes and
all related correspondence.)

BIDNO.' __96-01 |
®

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W. MAIN STREET, WALBALLA, SC 29691

The HUTCH-N-SON CONSTRUCTION
submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in
compliance with the description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for

30,000 - 40,000 cubic vards soil delivered to the Seneca Landfill

BASE BID - per cubic yard $ 2 ,95

Based on 30,000-40,000 cubic yards to be purchased

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.

Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental

Form attached bhereto.

Delivery Date:

Eujdmg Organi_zatjon: HUTCH-N-S0ON CONSTRUCTION
Address: BOX 1874 Seneca,,SC 29678

Signature of Bidders Representative:
. . D. HUTCHINSON
Title:__ owner Date: July 10, 1996

Telephone; 864-885-1688




BID SUPPLEMENTAL FORM | ,
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 WEST MAIN STREET

WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

96-~01
DATE. July 10,1996 BID NO.
The Hutch-N-Son Construction takes the following exceptions:
(Bidder) .

The £1il1l1 material will be panned into the site from accross the road
going to Englehart. A access gate will be needeqd.

HUTCH-N-SON CONSTZUCTION
SIGNATURE: ? J %"

H. D. HUTCHINSON




BIDNO. _ 96-01

Use this number envelopes and
all related correspondence.)

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
201 W, MAIN STREET, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The Thrift Brothers, Inc,
submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in
compliance with the description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for
30,000 - 40,000 cubi il delivered to the Seneca Lan

BASE BID - per cubic yard . $__4.00 per cv

Based on 30,000-40,000 cubic yards to be purchased

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice.
Show any exception, deviation, extra computation, or information on Bid Supplemental

Form attached hereto.

Delivery Date: __As_tieeded basis

Bidding Organization: Thrift Brothers, Inc.
Add_ress: P, O, Box 1293; SeneCa,__SC 29679

Signature of Bidders Representati é
Title: President Date;7—10—96 V
Telephone: 864-882-3931




OLDIE 8 @3SOCIATES  TEL: | Jul 16'96  13:15 Np.003 P.O1

TO: Marianne Dillard
Fax # 4384142

FROM: David Davoe D@
Goldia & Associatas
{854 ) 682-8194 ‘
FAX S82~8851 |

RE: [F22.15.12}
PAGES: I |
We have estimated the clay available at the Pruitt sites as
follows:
Pruitt Site #1 (site with house}: 62,600 yards
Pruitt Site #2 (site with trailoer ) 27,000 vards

We recommend that the County pursue ocbtaining this soil at a
reasonable cost, These figures rapresent approximately half of
tha amount of clay needed toc cap both the permitted and
unparmitted areas at the Seneca Landfill, including the vertical
expansion area (not including CaD area).

Plesase note that these filgures ave estimates and actual
quantities may be consliderably more or less. Agtuszl auantitiass
will not be known until the site (s saxcavated during
¢ongtruction.

If you have any questions or commants, please call.




RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE FIRST INTEREST PAYMENT DATE TO
BE MARCH 1, 1997 WITH RESPECT TO THE $2,800,000 OCONEE
COUNTY, SOUTH CAROLINA GENERAL OBLIGATION BONDS, SERIES
1996 HERETOFORE AUTHORIZED BY AN ORDINANCE ADOPTED BY
THE COUNTY COUNCIL ON JUNE 4, 1996 AND OTHER MATTERS WITH
RESPECT THERETO.

WHEREAS, the County Council of Oconee County, South Carolina did adopt on June
4, 1996 an ordinance authorizing the issuance of $2,800,000 Oconee County, South Carolina
General Obligation Bonds, Series 1996 (the "Bonds");

WHEREAS, it was anticipated that the Bonds would be issued in June of 1996;

WHEREAS, the Bonds will not receive a rating until on or about July 15, 1996 and it
is in the County’s best interest not to sell the Bonds until such ratings have been received.

NOW THEREFQRE BE IT RESOLVED

Section 1. The Bonds shall be dated the first day of the month in which the Bonds shall
be delivered such date being anticipated to be August 1, 1996.

Section 2. The first interest payment date shall be March 1, 1997 in lieu of September
1, 1996.

Section 3. All other terms of the Bonds shall remain as approved.
Done in meeting duly assembled this 16th day of July, 1996.

OCONEE COUNTY, SOUTH CAROLINA

By:

Norman D. Crain, Supervisor/

Chairman, Oconee County Council
Attest:

By:

Opal O. Green, Clerk to
County Council '



CREDIT APPLICATION

ONEE COUNTY ROCK CRUSHEh{
‘208 BOOKER DRIVE
WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

,WE OF APPLICANT Mwb\ﬁhe») D, Bﬁ)N& ALD!’-\ M. Re,s (‘)QQGRS‘}Q
RESS AT Do e e, e sk piushep STATESC Z18 .covn_z%?_;s .

TELEPHONE NUMBER  BUSINESS ,4/{(477- 2863 HOME
SOCIAL SECURITY # .75/ -32 -<219 'OR FEDERAL I.D. #57-0@31204

ADDRESS 27 Del4a_ DR Crﬂwesémf@mﬂmasc/m COPE, 9¢ 3.3
TYPE OF BUSINESS (LQNDE.QA@ -CN:SX\:LM; N_/ gﬁ,&&qfvf‘/

CREDIT INFORMATION
ONE REFERENCE MUST BE A BANK OR LENDING INSTITUTION OR BRANCH THEREOF DULY
CHARTERED AND DOING BUSINESS IN OCONEE COUNTY, SOUTH CAROLINA; ONE REFERENCE
MUST BE A MAJOR CREDIT CARD COMPANY; AND THREE REFERENCES MUST BE OCONEE
COUNTY BUSINESS PERSONS OR ESTABLISHMENTS WITH WHOM OR WHICH THE APPLICANT HAS
ENJOYED CREDIT FOR A MINIMUM OF THREE YEARS.

IF AN APPLICANT DDES NOT QUALIFY ACCORDING TO THE ABOVE REQUIREHENTS, HE MAY
FURNISH AN IRREVOCABLE LETTER OF CREDIT FRCM A QUALIFIED BANK FOR THE- AMOUNT
HE INTENDS TO PURCHASES ON A MONTHLY BASIS. . : : :

. ‘ | EEFER...""'E".‘, | | o

1. NAME OF BANK, MAJOR CREDIT CARD OR VENDOR: EQNMWNIH fﬁé;, %M)b
ADDRESS $Q o 1097, wa\Ne) sy S g, TELEPHONE | 205 j0S
2. NAME OF BANK, MAJOR CREDIT CARD OR VENDOR: rjdLjE, G:IV\ <2JPYE;£)
ADDRESS Yo i 7600 Cubiko) é]—&%m T j TELEPHONE 947/ wwd |

3. NAME QF BANK, MAJOR CREDIT CARD DR VENDOR: OGOU&& IMPI@M‘QNJ'

ADDRESS 324 ) pdase St ‘u) o 1), 5  p (o TELEPHONE.
4. NAME OF BANK, MAJOR CREDIT CARD OR VENDOR: {R.ar po s GNCQW

ADDRESS o, ooy 189 W estroinster SCzy), yZELEPHONE (97 (000
5. NAME OF BANK, MAJOR CREDIT CARD OR VENDOR: ANQ%“V A Lo !Pug.jg

P o & ity ST sy o SO TELEFHONE G L7 - S0/

I/WE CERTIFY THE ABOVE INFORMATION TO BE ACCURATE, AND I/WE GIVE THE COUNTY
AUTHORITY TO VERIFY THE INFORMATION. N

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

A $50.00 APPLICATION FEE SLOULD BE ATTACHED WITH THIS COMPLETED APPLICATION.
THIS IS A NON-REFUNDABLE FEE.




p7/18/1936 13:19  B03-882-2793 CREDIT BUREAU OCONEE PAGE Bl .

+¥Teanamltiing ECIS re?ueats...**
"’-'bling 180054558770
r2 inected at 2400 Baud®"

{FB)PLEASE SIGN-ON
BABERABASSONSRS

~498D - PROCEED

HRequest 4300

0 -BOKD, MICHAEL D, ,.

PA-271 DEYLA, DR, RESTRINSTER, SC, 29491,
B-585-251-02-821%,B05-d5/22/44.

* 020 EQUIFAX GREDIT INFORMATION SERVICES, P 0 BUX T4024%, . o
5505 PEACHTREE DUNWOODY RD STE 600,ATLANTA,GA,30374-0241,770/612 3200 .o

*BOND ,MICHAEL,D SINCE 03/04/86 'FAD 12,/04/95 FN-242 ' T
277 ,DELTA.DR,WESTMINSTER, SC, 296493, TAPE RPTD 03/93 ' ’ : o
2279 ,DR JOUNS,RD,WESTMINSTER,SC,29693,TAPE RPTD 10,92 '
B 35%8,RT 1, ,WESTMINSTER,SC, 29693, TAPE RPTD 05/30
BDS-05/00/46,555-251-82-8279

1 ES-SELF,MIKES CONCRETE FINISHING

2 EF -GRADING, SELF

‘Sl.}fl/SS 07/9%,PR/01-NO,FB-NO, ACCTS:20,HC$580-75324, 1 ZERO, 19 ONER.

* INQS - EQFX~-RISK 401YC363 06/25/96 WACH- SALFN 401BB7230 12.,/04./9%

GMAC 304FA135 L2/01795 C CITIZEN BK 401BB1dS40 127017495
MAYPOLE T403IANZU2E L2700, 90 MWCC/WARD 4904DC10o03 1), 30 40
GMAC 430FATS 10/15/94 FCB SLSFIN 416BB4420 10/15.94
FIRM/1D CODE RPTD OPND H/C TRM BAL P/D €5 MR ECOA ACCOUNT NUMBER ;
EERE MDSN'YGESONIL52 06,86 04,30 2500 ¥, Rl LT BOO5319031234539 ;
AMOUNT IN H/C COLUMN 18 CREDIT LIMIT _
OMM FIRST*430BB28S9 06,96 02/96 5000 3M 0 1t 04 1 21303102u6
PAID ACCOUNT/ZERQ BALANCE :
OMM FIRST*430BB2S89 06/96 01,96 12K 377 11K i1 01 | 219530198
TOMM FIRSTY430BB2SS9  06/96 10,/%2 29K T72 3025 i 44 1 : Sa43TInad
YIOBFA A 07/96 12/85 22K 415 20K It 08 I 34y 1363 88988 j
AUTO i
: TO905FALA 07/96 10/94 15K 253 9370 I1 20 1 115 230110629 5
30DC043860(0H)30+ (00 01/96-12,11,/95-12,08,95-12 DLA 06/98
AUTO !
ONT/WARD "206DC136 06/96 11/85 G550 D R u? 1 CPSRI1512-5218939
COMUNTY Viv4200NI65 06,96 0194 2500 40 308 Ri 24 |} 412ib3c1a00d1a0l
AMOUNT IN H/C COLUMN (S CREDIT LIMIT
UNB SC *430BBYSS 05798 03/92 COK 415 4170 1 18 I 10051137k
ASE CREDI*66SAF4L121 03,96 04,03 22K 481 11K It 24 1 290305700005
CURED
-AsinEDI'GGSAFHM L 968 02/94 25K 684 61538 11 20 1 2909057000041
SECURED -
UNB *§05BBST407 0426 04/89 3284 10 207 R1 §3 i 1310098399108060
CREDIT CARD _ :
HLD BK *163BB21479 06/96 04/93 3000 10 26 R1 3§ 1 00VILLISTYIZT

CREDIT CARD
AMOUNT IN H/C COLUMN IS CREDIT LIMIT




@7/18/19%6 13:19

A

COMM FIRST*436382389 03/96 03,/93 (2K ™ 0 I1 36 1
AlD ACCOUNT/ZERG BALANCE
B ER *430FP483 07/35 06/93 2589 108 0 [f 28 J
PAID ACCOUNT/ZERO BALANCE o
CASE CREDIYE68AF4121 06/95 10/92 735K LK O [3 22 1
PAID ACCOUNT/ZERCG BALANCE ’
SECURED _
FUNB 3C Y430BBYGS 09/93 08/92 7908 4K 0 It 111
30(01)60(Q0)90+(00)
FUNB §C *43J0BB9GS 09,93 al/92 6105 1K 0 I1 16 1
FUNB 3C Y430BBULY 05,83 0L,/90 12K 408 0 Ii 36 I
FUNB SC F430BBAGS us, 92 97,/92 7045 TK 0 I i
&
END OF REPOHT EQUIFAX AND AFFILIATES 07/1G/96
CREDIT BUREAU OF OCONEE COUNTY
Oconee
Impl. opened 220+ H.credit 20,000 owes s. curr,
Barretts Hdwe Opened 20Yrs HC 1,500. owes 234.00.

Anderson Auto opened 10 yrs HC 1,400. owes

693-B82-2793

Pq A Ineifane B. Lurse.

CREDIT BUREAU OCONEE

14,

'PAGE - B2

SuRG13638%

4000500353130”“

290905700003

1003122263
bLa 03,93 _
AL003118387
41003102641
ALBO3L2L135T

0-1
0-1

0-1

{all above paid each month with discount for

prompt pay)




ETATE OF BOUTH CARCLINA
COORTY OF DQOMEER
RESOLUTION 8630 .-~ s

WHEREAE the National wWrastling Hall af Fam&'ln Btiliwall,
Sklahoma iz establishing an annuﬁl awartd Fo¥ State, Regional and
National Citizen-Schalar Wrestlers ta be sﬁ;ﬁﬁtﬂd from the ranks
of graduating senicra Ffor Hall nf Faie rscﬁgﬂLtlﬂn;Land

WHERERE, the state w1nnﬂr$* nLames w11h ﬁe dlaplayad in the
Hall of Fame for ons y&arf and

WHEREAS, ndam Duncai 1g a member of the Hrﬁstllng Tean and &
1ﬁ9ﬁ Graduate of WE&I Dak Hidgh Scnnnl+ and

WHERERS , the Dcnnea,cnunty Euun:il a8 Etha governing. body of
Ooonas County, Bouth Carﬁl%ﬁa desires to recoagnize and hﬂnnr Bdam
Duncan for esacning the ;T§;Etﬂf "ETATE WRESTLER OF THE YEAR" and
the ¢itla of "HOUTH usm,msmﬂn OF THE ¥YEAR™; and

Aow R
-

,,,,,

WHERE‘AE, Rdam - Dutica®Tal’ example of  8elf dlseipllne ‘and
lﬂadﬂrship which resulted in his receiwing Eevéral ayards during
hiz high schoal mrestling sareer will sarve as an Example tooall

e

thode who fﬂlldw.hlm on the West dak Wrestling Team.

H'EIF ﬂllﬂ!ﬂlﬂ, lBE b i | E.H:EQLT.ED, tha_‘l‘. Al E_:hi:-y |‘_'u'f thHig réamlutlnh
‘be sent te 2dap Bincad &pd. that a copy sha®l besforsver inecribed
upoh the Dfﬂiﬂiﬁliﬁgﬁﬂtﬂﬁhﬂﬂ Doonee Cmunty,:ﬂgqth Caraling.

DONE, RETIF;HD W ADROTTED, T Eﬂunty‘”ﬂhly assamhled this
‘sightesnth day of June, 19%6 at Walhalls, South Carclina. -=

Norman ©. Craln
Fupervisor-chalrman
gconed Dounty Councll

Atteat: el BT

Dpal ©. Green
Council Cletrk

{Seal)



BTATE OF EOUTH. CAROLINA
COUNTY OF OCOMEE
RESOLUTION 96=31 :

IHERELB, thers WaTE MOre than 10,000 entries 1ﬁ the HYHS
TEEHAGE AMERICA PRDGRhH which was.held in Lusthngelas, California
t | A

WHERBAS, S=neca native Eh:tﬂey Jnuhséﬁ. H&E nne'nf tha

“ntriEE in the HIEE TEEHHEE EHEEIQB PRﬂGEﬁH and k

WHERFRE, the GﬂﬂnEE Eﬂuﬂty:Cnuﬁcil -HSwthE g&varning hody of

Dconee County, Enuth Carﬂ4&na daairea te extend ﬂnngratﬂlatLunE t

h!.l.\.

thtnnr Jnuksqn;nn haingjnaﬁadtthe Flrst ronner—ip 1n‘thE.HIEH

R e ]
A e

TEENRGE nunn:nn PRUGEAH uaufi

o T
£ '--"'l.?."‘-f ."
L

HOW TBEEEFDEE, EE IT REEHL?ED, Ethat, a cﬂy nf this: resnlutlﬂn

be sent fﬁiﬂhltniﬁ dh:ksnn and that a cnpy ahall ke Iurauar

IHEEILbEd;quﬁ ﬁhe afticlal recg:ﬂs nf Gﬁunahutaunty, squth

Ed ?I"n:..r 1..: .-' l'-..'ﬂ\“"'l -ﬂ-"”:'.‘r"'.--pf*-'l-- i '

carolina. 0 uaa B A e ST U
i 'fﬂfnqxh

DQONE, RhTiFIED & ADOPTED, -in tnuncll &uIy EBﬂFmblaﬂ thlB

eighteenth day ot Juqa, 1595“qt Walhallz, South carolina.”

" m— e

Horman D. Crailn
T Supervitar-Chairman
chneé County Council

Attest: - MU

gpal ¢. Gresn
Council Clerk

feeal)



STATE OF SCOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF OCOMEE
RESOLUTION $6-32

WHEREAE, Walhallas High Hchnhl haz bebn recognized by the
HATIONAL COUNCIL OF HRESEARCH AND. ?ECETIDIM ﬁ_ﬁﬂ“ﬂﬁTIﬂH for its
NECHOOL TO WOREK PROGHAN™: and & ..;_*f'”- _

WHERERE, of fThe thirt? {Enj EﬂhﬂﬂlE 1ntervlﬁwad &croas the
Unites States; WALHALLA HIEE "BEROOL was tha anly Sautherh Bileh
Sehonl selected; and

WEEREARS, thlz hondt would not have béen pbﬁsihlﬁpwithuut the
dediecatlon, leadership and hard -werk af Principal John Hostatler,
Career Speclalist . Eick Murphy, +the Hamilton Carssr Caotar,
teachers, studunts, &nd dﬂnpﬂrtlva ataff.

NOW THEREFORE, BE I¥ REBOLVED, in Council duly sssenbled this
‘date that thé Oconee Cnmgﬁ% ‘Council, =38 the governing body of
Ooohas County, Sguth Qard&IHﬁ extands congratulations to WALMALLA
HIGH BCHOOL “for its recognition by the NATIONAL COUNCIL OF
REETARCH AND FDEEE;EHﬂL EDUCATION for exﬂdllenﬂe in caunseling Aand
Caresr pl&hnlng > }

] Eal - ] =3
J' " k

FUHTHER, BE AT HEED‘L\FED th}l‘!’_ Hﬂlﬂﬂ%&‘fﬂﬂ]{ EﬂHﬂﬂL, ahlﬂ tha
HAMILTON CAREEN CENTER ressive s copy of Jﬂs Pézolutien and that
a copy shallﬁﬁ& fﬁ;gggqniﬁscribed Upen “ths af}lﬂial reacords of
Doones Gﬂuntye I T

B e e L

DONE; R.'&TIFIED & ADOPFTER, 1n C!cmnc.il duly assenbled at
Walhalla, qnuth Carblina, ;hls elghteenth aay orf June, 13%&.

Norman 0. Crailn
Bupervigor-rhairman
Ooonee County Council

ftteat: 'h“ i

opal 4. Green
Council Clerk

fGeal)



ETATE OF SOUTH CARCLINA
COUNTY OF OCONEE (.~ i

RESCOLUTION ‘§6-33 e
WHEREAS, the Walhalla Baseball maut'. hiss ‘A 133 ouarall
record; and : o "1, It

- r.{ 1

. T .chrr .

WHEREAS, the Walballa Basesball Taum WQn the 1995 8kylina
Championahip; and :
WHEREAS, thé5nﬂﬂné§ Enunty Eﬂunéil a8 the goverhdng body of

oCones Countsyr, Enuth Caqu;ﬁa extends coagratulatlions td the
‘\l---.J i

B NS

Walhalla Ena&h;li T@BM. 523k 1 4

ale -.uq11. -
l-'"'-r'-"l-: it

WO THEREFORE, BE Iﬁﬁﬂﬁnm, that the walhalla Bageball

s

. Toat reue:a'.rﬂ a E!-D‘ji’ c:f t'!us rgsnlutinn and that a cngr uf this
resolutiod” shatl“be Farever ;nacrlbed apan the nlficlnl reLurds of
Doones Ev:nu.ntj,-, '.S'q:uth ﬂaru] inas B ,-_-'.}:-“.'." h

r-I‘III L i .“‘_._

DONE, HLEIEIEQ,Q ARGETED, in Emuncli ﬂgi& assemhled at
Walhalla, Seuth® Earullna this eighteenth dhy n? jﬂn& 19?53__

-y A
- L I . i
T o+

Norman D. Cratin
A Bupsrvisor-Chairman
ooones County Counsil

Atteat: "L o

Dpal oL Graen "
Counsil Clerk

(#eal)



