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AGENDA
OCONEE COUNTY COUNCIL MEETING
TUESDAY, JANUARY 18, 2000
3:00 PM
OCONEE COUNTY ADMINISTRATIVE OFFICES
415 SOUTH PINE STREET
WALHALLA, SC

Call to Order

Invocation

Public Comment Session not to Exceed Thirty Minutes

Approval of Minutes (1/4/00 & 1/11/00)

Consideration of Request of Funds in the Amount of $1625.70 for Paralegal
Classes for the Administrative Assistant & Account Clerk in Solicitor’s Office —
Ms. Chnstina T. Adams, Deputy Solicitor

Consideration of Lease Award for Approximately Thirty-five (35) Acres of
Cultivated Land Located Near the Road Department — Ms. Marianne Dillard,
Purchasing Agent

Consideration of Bids for Digital Copiers for Sheriff’s Office & Communications
— Chief Deputy Steve Pruitt & Ms. Marianne Dillard, Purchasing Agent

Consideration of Bids for Wheel Loader for Rock Crusher — Mr. Tommy
Crumpton, Rock Crusher Director & Ms. Marianne Dillard, Purchasing Agent

Discussion & Possible Action Regarding Census 2000 — Mr. Charles R. Timms,
Council Member, District V

Appointment of Representatives to the SC Appalachian Council of Governments
Board

First Reading of Ordinance 2000-02, “THE 1999-2000 SUPPLEMENTAL
APPROPRIATION ORDINANCE” in title only

Old Business
New Business

Adjourn

The Oconee County Council will have an administrative briefing thirty minutes prior to
each Council Meeting in the Office of the Council Clerk



MEMBERS, OCONEE COUNTY COUNCIL
Mr. Tim O. Hall, I, District I Mr. J. Harold Thomas, District 11
Mr. Harry R. Hamilton, District I Mrs. Ann H. Hughes, District IV
Mr. Charles R. “Chuck” Timms

MINUTES, OCONEE COUNTY COUNCIL MEETING

‘The Oconee County Council met Tuesday, January 18, 2000 at 3:00 PM in
Council Chambers, 415 South Pine Street, Walhalla, SC with all Council Members and
Brad Norton, Acting County Attorney present.
Press:

Members of the press notified (by mail): Journal Tribune, Keowee
Courier, Westminster News, Anderson Independent, Greenville News, WGOG Radio,
WSNW Radio, WCCP Radio, WPEK Radio, The Times Upstate, WYFF TV, WLOS TV
& WSPATV.

Members of the press present: Dick Mangrum — WGOG Radio, Katherine
Wise - Journal/Tribune, & Dave Williams -- Anderson Independent.

Call to Order:

The meeting was called to order by Supervisor-Chairman Orr who
welcomed the guests and media.

Invocation:
The invocation was given by Mr. Thomas.

Public Comment Session:

Ms. Ann Brackett, DHEC Home Health; Ms. Sandra Pruitt, DSS Family
Friends and Ms. Gail Phillips, OVIS United Way Agency addressed Council regarding
the need for public transportation in the county.

Mr. B. J. Littleton expressed concern about building codes and the need
for top mount fire trucks in the county.

Minutes:
Mr. Thomas made a motion, seconded by Mrs. Hamilton approved 5 - 0

that the minutes of the regular meeting held January 4, 2000 and the special meeting held
January 11, 2000 be adopted as printed.



Minutes, Oconee County Council Meeting January 18, 2000

Solicitor’s Office:

Ms. Christina Adams, Deputy Solicitor requested contingency funds in the
amount of $1625.70 for the Administrative Assistant and the Account Clerk in the
Solicitor’s Office to take paralegal classes via the Internet. Mr. Orr referred this request
to the Budget & Finance Committee. (Sec attached request)

Budget & Finance Meet:

The Budget & Finance Committee scheduled a meeting Tuesday, February
1, 2000 at 6:00 PM in Council Chambers to discuss the above referenced matter.

Lease of Acreage Tract:

Upon recommendation of Ms. Marianne Dillard, Purchasing Agent, Mr.
Thomas made a motion, seconded by Mrs. Hughes, approved 5 — 0 that the bid of
Richard Marcengill, who was high bid at $451 for one year lease with option to renew be
accepted on the thirty-five (35) acre tract of land owned by the county and leased for
agricultural purposes. (See attached bid sheet)

Copiers for Sheriff’s Department:

Upon recommendation of Chief Deputy Steve Pruitt and Ms. Dillard, Mrs.
Hughes made a motion, seconded by Mr. Timms, approved 5 — 0 that the bid of Kearns
Business Products, who was low bid at $22,919.40 for two copiers for the Sheriff’s
Department be adopted. (See attached bid sheet)

Wheel Loader for Rock Crusher:

Upon recommendation of Mr. Tommy Crumpton, Rock Crusher Director
& Ms. Dillard, Mr. Hall made a motion, seconded by Mrs. Hughes, approved 5 — 0 that
the bid of Interstate Equipment Co. who was low bid at $398,865 for a wheel loader for
the Rock Crusher be adopted. (See attached bid sheet)

Census Committee:

Mr. Timms made a motion, seconded by Mr. Thomas, approved 5 — 0 that
the attached listing of expenditures for the Census Committee be adopted:

Bumper Stickers: $495.00
Signs: $400.00
Pad Advertisements: $100.00
TOTAL: $995.00



Minutes, Oconee County Council Meeting January 18, 2000

COG Appointments:

Mr. Hamilton made a motion, seconded by Mrs. Hughes, approved 5 — 0
that Mr. Robert Gaillard be reappointed to the SC Appalachian Council of Governments
Board as the Oconee County citizen representative and Ms. Vikki Allen be reappointed as
the Oconee County minority representative.

Ordinance 2000-02:

Mr. Hamilton made a motion, seconded by Mr. Timms, approved 5 — 0
that Ordinance 2000-02, “THE 1999-2000 SUPPLEMENTAL APPROPRIATIONS
ORDINANCE” be adopted on first reading in title only.

Ad Hoc Committee:

Mr. Thomas suggested that all the Council Members call their appointees
to the Ad Hoc Recreation Committee to determine if they wanted to serve on the
comimittee or present a new nominee for the committee to Council at the February 1,
2000 Council Meeting,

Tax Center Entrance:

Mr. Thomas made a motion, seconded by Mr. Hall, approved 5 — 0 that the
County proceed with making an entrance into the Tax Center and the County Engineer
and Purchasing Agent secure a cost for this project. Further, that when the Pine Street
Complex is completed that a map of the building with parking lots for various offices be
published in the local papers and bronze plaque with the Supervisor’s name and Council
Members’ names be placed on the front of the Oconee County Administrative Offices
Building.

Grants Coordinator:

Mr. Thomas also expressed feelings that the Grants Coordinator position
should be upgraded to include seeking grants for the county.

LEC Meet:
The Law Enforcement, Safety, Health, Welfare & Services Committee

scheduled a meeting Tuesday, February 1, 2000 at 5:00 PM in Council Chambers for the
purpose of discussing Courthouse security and animal control.



Minutes, Oconee County Council Meeting January 18, 2000
Retreat:

Mr. Hall complimented the Supervisor and staff on the good planning
retreat held Monday, January 17, 2000 at Ramada Inn, but he also expressed feelings that
any future retreats should be held in Oconee County.

Purchase Meet:

The Purchasing, Contracting, Real Estate, Building & Grounds Committee
scheduled a meeting Monday, January 24, 2000 at 1:00 PM in Council Chambers for the
purpose of making a field trip to view county properties identified in the short range plan
at the Retreat for the purpose of making a recommendation to full Council regarding their
use. This will include the lot that was willed to the County at Lake Keowee.

Roads Meet:
The Roads & Transportation Committee scheduled a meeting Monday,
January 24, 2000 at 5:30 in Council Chambers for the purpose of discussing the State

Transportation Improvement Program and other road concerns.

Resolution 2000-01:

Mr. Hall made a motion, seconded by Mrs. Hughes, approved 5 — 0 that
Resolution 2000-01, “A RESOLUTION IN OBSERVANCE OF BLACK HISTORY
MONTH DURING FEBRUARY 2000 be adopted on first and final reading.

Vehicles for County Use (Contingency):

Mr. Thomas made a motion, seconded by Mr. Timms that $50,000 be
taken from contingency for the purchase of surplus vehicles and the monies be placed
back in contingency in the supplemental ordinance.

Mr. Hall made a motion, seconded by Mrs. Hughes that the motion be
amended that the Coroner, Economic Development, Assessor and Sign Technician
receive one of the vehicles. After considerable discussion, this motion and second was
withdrawn.

Mr. Thomas made a motion, seconded by Mr. Hall, approved 4 — 1 (Mr.
Hamilton voting against) that the motion be amended that the Purchasing, Contracting,
Real Estate, Building & Grounds Committee along with Supervisor Orr determine where
the vehicles will be assigned.

The motion, as amended, was then adopted 4 — 1 {Mr. Hamilton voting
against).



Minutes, Oconee County Council Meeting January 18, 2000

Adjourn:

Adjourn: 4:45 PM

Respectfully Submitted,
Opal O. Green
Council Clerk



Office of Bolicitor

TENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT
ANDERSON & OCONEE COUNTIES
AT OCONEE COUNTY
OCONEE COUNTY COURTHOUSE
WALHALLA, SC 29691
TELEPHONE (264) 6384294

. ANDERSON COUNTY
ANDERSON COUNTY COURTHOUSE
ANDERSON, 5C 25621
TELEPHONE (864) 2604046

GEORGE M. DUCWORTH, SOLICITOR

January 13, 2000

To:  Oconee County Council Members
From: Chrissy Adams, Deputy Solicitor
Re:  Funds for Classes for Administrative Assistant and Account Clerk

The Solicitor’s Office would like to request funds for paralegal classes for the
Administrative Assistant and Account Clerk in the amount of $1625.70. The delicacy
with which legal matters are handled requires a complex knowledge of the proper legal
processes to follow. These courses offer an opportunity for the above-mentioned
employees to benefit the County and the Solicitor’s Office (as well as themselves) by

. using betler, more efficient methods to prepare and process legal information within
proper legal guidelines. As the new Deputy Solicitor, 1 feel there is a need for more in-
depth legal training for these positions within the Solicitor’s office. I regret that these
courses were not included in the original budget or the supplemental appropriations
request, but I only recently became aware of their availability in our area.

I have attached a copy of the information regarding cost, description of courses, etc.

I would respectfully request to be placed on the agenda for January 18™ for Council’s
consideration. - As you can see from the documentation attached, the next scheduled class
is to begin February 9™ and registration needs to be done as soon as possible.

Thank you for your consideration.

Sincerely,

Christina T. Adams
Deputy Solicitor



Date Course # Course Title .| Course Desc. Course Cost ‘Text Cost
2/9/2000 | SYN 515 #1-Legal Overview of American $195 X 2=$390 | $137.50X 2=

Terminology, judicial system focusing . $275.00

Process, Ethics, | on origins and litigation .

Tort, & Contract | process

Law o
4/12/2000 | SYN 516 #2-Legal Overview of common . $195 X 2=$390 | (Use same text)

: Documents & legal documents & :
Analysis training to analyze legal
problems i

6/14/2000 | SYN 517 #3-Evidence,. | Overview of how $195 X 2=$390 | 79.50 X 2=$159

Legal
Interviewing &
Investigation

evidence is gathered and
used in a civil case.

Total $1170.00

Total $434.00+
5% tax =
$455.70

Grand Total
Funds Requested
$1170.00 +
$455.70
=$1625.70

o

Each course is 6 weeks in length. The courses are to be taken in sequence as presented.

- There are three additional courses which will be scheduled in the 2000/2001 budget year.-
These classes will be in the budget submission for that period. :
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Parzlegal Certificate Program 4

This tourss plovides youwith tha skill YOu resgd do
conduct ledqal respgngh,

Requirements:

Intermet access. E-inail Neticape or Intemat
Faplarer Web browear, High-School Dipiomz
o eciialant GAhana experienteE andiar iz
cfficerexperienca’is helphu| But rdk resjuined.

Yol will aksa naed b purchiasa e following
tetbinoks: _

4 fafraduction bo Faralagalism!
Perspectives. Problems and Skills, B
Editian, by Wikiarm Etaaak',l
|"-'|II'IF‘-EEI:'J!:||I3'E’( Paul West Publishing
Company, TH97. 371

% F‘!ar-ajegal Procedures and. Practices, oYy
2cott A ardiLiza Fmimer Haten,
Minfeapolis/St Paul, VWest Puldlishing
Cormpany, 1953, 523

Mail tiock arders o

Iha Centerfor Lega. Studies
22316 Sunget Drive
Galden; 0800

Faxfo

A03-536-5410.

Phaons o
1-800-522-7 737

Students shouid have tha fallowirig
imfammation. name, a-maitaddrass, phane
mirabar, and staat address o B0 -baxes)

Arcepabia payment metheds: Viga,
REskercand, Discover Card, American
Express, Check, or Maoney Ordsr,
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Frustration & Lega: Researcy

Wadnesday - Legson 05
Legal Rasearch Toals
Fritlay - Lesson &
ICRESklists
Weoedneeday - Lessan 07
Legal Encyclopasdiss
Fricay - Lesson 08
ALRGE Digesis
S,
Wadnesday - Legson 09
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Citation Fommat
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Legal Research Practios
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Legal Resesrch Practics; confnued
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Belorg YR cotast Paralagal Cortlflcate Program &

Thig colrse explaing how fo.use computers ta assizt
i legal reseanch. You will practice your legal writing
skills by prepanhg & sample apoaiiate bnef,

Reguirsments:

Internat acoees, E-mmail, Netscape of Intarict
Explorer Wel brawser. High Schoal Diplema
ar. equivalent, Galkege BxpErence anoior law
officefxperience i3 hefpful but nat sequired.

You will alao need to purchage the foliawing
texthooks:
= Basicz of Legsl Docaiment Preparation,
RoGer /. Eurrmms Albary: ' Delmar
Fiblishers g, 1957, 532

= tnirad udton i Parale:_gallsm
Parepectivas. Prablems ard Skills, Sth
Editiant, by \Willizarr - Shalsky,
rAirneapolis!St. Faul West Punlishing:
Campany, 1807, 571 ’ ’

“n Maraiegal Procecures and Fractoas, by
Spoit- A snd LigsZimmar Hatzly
Minneapolis’St, Paul: West Pudllshing
Comaany, 1993, k23,

Mail book orders to:

TheOenter fior Legal Stdies
22116 Sunsat Drivva
Goddat, G0 80401

Faeta:
AG3-h26-54 15

Phang: ko
1-BQ0-E22T ST

Students shauid have the follcoving
rfermation: pame, esmail address,. phons
aumbar, and straat address [no PO baxes),

Amepi.-ati{-a paymant mathods: Wiss,
WMastercard, Dissovar Gand, Amedcan
Express. Chack. or Marsay Order,

For sacdre anling ordanng e
Daned B0 ET0R SO

Syllabus:

AN doureds ron forsn waeks, Twi lessonsans
relearad gach waalk for e Skrank durmiog
UJ’.!.'].E COLEe r’n:nu il nit have o oe prascht
e e Icssan 5 eleased Instedd you e
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Computerized Legal Research
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Lanal Writing
Friday - Legkson 04
Grﬁmmar E&ntence Sirteiure & Punctuaticn

E s & i m 3

W&dn&adw Les:sun 123
Paragraph Cirganization
Friday - Lezsgn 08
Appaliate Procadurs

Wednesday - Lesson 07
Crganization of the Appelizte Brisf
Friday - Lesson 0B
Pré'limiha"g.r Pages, _Ari;umenjt_tfi Ce:':nn-::!usiqn

Wednesday - Lesson 09
Appeliste Biief Researdh
Fridzy. - Lesson 10
Appeliata Brisf Research, conliquad
Wadnesday - LEEE-DIFI 11
Preparation of the-Appelidte Briaf
Friday -Lesson 12
Hrepargtion of the AppallEte Brief continued
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and Liniversites. and has been named one of
the: Cutstand ing Young Men of Amearica by the
Liniked States Jayeaas: He was a conlibuling
efiad 1o The: Judicsal Bredlad (MeGSizw-Hill
and the Calorado Law Annctatad
Pestilanpars Co-op)sesies, snd adiir of
seiraral award-winning putficalicnz He i

suthar of Paralegal Proceduras and Practicas.

pubdished by Wast Pubfishing, aswell 85
bBocks@n mediation and legalinvestigstian.
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CRLERSIE S Paralegal Certificats Program & in i
Leg, briy -eady

This course provides & leok oto theeparalegal In tha
fand offise and prasants eehnigues for findimg 8ok
a% a paralegal

Requirgments:

intemet acceas. E-mail Metscape-ar Internst
Explorer Wely browser, High Schocl Biplama
arequivaient, College expenance andier 3w
office expenanca s halful bt #ict requined

ou will also-raed [ pirchass the follcsing
restncaks
v Basics of Lagal Decumant Preparaban,
Raobeart B-Cumrning, Albany: Delrmar
Publishars ng., 1897, 532

= Introduciion fo Paralagalisom;:
Permpectives, Problems end Skills; §th
Editiar; by Widiam Siatsk
i inneapaliziSt. Faul vest Publishing
Catnipany, 1587 -0

o Pargiegal Progedures and Practices, by
SCofl A and Liss Zimeser Hatzh.
MinneEapaler St Pacl vWest Fublishing
Company, 1592, 323

il Btk arders b

The Center for Legal Studiss
22316 Sunast Drive
Grsden, GO 80801

Faw 1o
ABB2E-54 15

Fhone:io;
1-B0E2 T TaT

Shudarte sheuld have the Tolleaing
irfarmation; merme, E=mail sddress, phone
purtber and sireet addressino PO bodes),

Boceptanle payment methods: Yisa,
Mastercaid, Discover Jard, Amercan
Express, Check, o Money Ordsr

Far secite tnlife ondsrmg use

Syltabus:

Al Colrses i Tor sl weeks, Twi lessens am
releasad saohl waek for the sivweet duration
afthe couraes, Yau dp ot havs o Be proseat
when the feason is rekassad, nFhead, you can
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aftor s el sad

Wednesday - Leggon 1

Cotrputars in the Law Office
Friday - Lagson 02

Law Office Sdeministration
e BT SE
Wednesday - Lesson 02

Office Prosedures for 8 Large Firm
Friday - Lessorr0d

Crifice Frocedures for 8 Small Finm
Wadnesday - Lesaon 05

Litrgabar- Assistantship
Friday - Lesson DB

Agency Heanngs
Wadnesday - Lesson 07

Infermal davotacy
Friday - Lesson 0

Farmal Advpcacy
Wednesday - Lesson 08

Real Extate & Buzimess Documanits
Friday - Lesson 10
Wiills, Trusts & Barknupicy Bocuments

e T LT

B T e
Wednesday - Lesson 11

Domestic Relations Decumants
Frigay - Lesgon 12
Jab Huriting

Instructor;

E T Hach-hag
5 presentad parplenal
Courses since 930
and presently offers
B! e Faralens]
 Cerficate Course ai
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ard-universities
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January 5, 2000 Cultivated Land for Lease Bid No. 99-26
Walhatla, SC 29691
Richard
. BIDDER Marcengill Robert King Carol Hendrix  |Jack Arnold
%
One Year Lease 451.00 421.04 no bid no bid

Ann Albertson

Attended Bid Opening: Marianne Dillard, Robert King, Harold Thomas,

bidtab99-26.xls




S ¥ - — = —/

I am interested in leasing the plus or minus thirty-five (35) acres of cultivated land and will offer

o _
. to pay $ 4 |~ ____ per year, according to the conditions stated

Signed w

address. NS HEE °

Address VOSREALLA .. 206U

Phone Number (938 =02 ® | wefud L5V
Dae =% 13- 2000 Efine

above,

I am interested in leasing the plus or minus thirty-five (35) acres of cultivated land and will offer

to pay $ 40[) J ey per year, according to the conditions stated

% a,ﬂl‘?U Signed %ﬁ /{_7
@\l Address ?35 /7] f%’ Fé/// “
Address MQ//HL#!%(‘ SL J?fo&

Phone Number 5/o4/- (A7 - 2600
Date /= 3-30c0




Dece. 8, 1999

",um to” . Bid 99-00
Copiers Digital
T 7 i-
./ Quality Professlonal
Sheoriff & Kearnes Konica ; ! Business |Southern Offics Office
Feature Comm, lkon Business Prod | Business Tech | Office Pro Office Pre Plus In¢ L Ptus Ing Systomns Systoms Inc . Products
I | Royal Copystar
Brand and Mods! - Mita Al 4040 Konica 7040 | Savin 9945DP Konica7150 | MinottaDI520 | 40006 | nobid
Base Bid forCopler 23 __6,900.00 | 12,700.00 (§ 1399500 | § 6,928.00
lestimeted annual volurne L - D ) L
[copier stand {console) T 120000
copies per minta 1 - 40 B
computer Interface capabilities - as stated in ! !
Minimtsn Spacs | X yes yas A j §1,44700
resohation 600 x 600 dpi - copy, scan, print, grey | . 400 - 600 ‘ '
scate 250 levels X 400 x 400 yes __,__ seleciable yes ; i
memory 32 MB upgradsble to 128 MB e Yes yes | 16080 incl ;
document procassor capacity 70 ofiginals X yes yas yes P yas 100 sheets
continucus copying up to 999, auto reset to 1 X _yes yes yes T yes S R
meximum copy size o Hxir yes yes 1 _yes | yes yes yes R L
minimum copy size 55" X85 yes yes yes yes yes Yyes | -
¥ of paper trays 3 yes 2-550 . yos ; 2-500 2-500 . yes _ ) .
ca of paper trays 1-3000, 2-550! 1-1500, 2-500 $1.085.00 yes | 2-500$956.00 | 2-500 $956.00 ; 1-1500, 2-500 00 | 7,23000shasts | § 942.00
manual by-pass 100 sheet X yes - 50 yes ‘ _yes 50 50 ‘ yes | 1 o
variable magnification 256-400% X yes yes i yes i yes yes yes _ -
stackless duplexing up to 999 sheets X yes _yes _ yes yes : yes yes ]
digital effects o incl image reverse, image |
combination, image rotation, image overlay, i ! :
bookiet mode, rotate sort, miror image, page ‘ ; ‘ ! ;
numbering, electronic sorting X yos yes | yos : yes ‘ yes i yes yes ;
abliity to scan additional jabs into memory while ‘% ] I ]
one jobis unaling X __¥es  _ yes | yes yes yes yes .. 4 |
ook co . B . X yes yes yes . yes yes yes yes _ i
iphoto copy I yes yes __yes yes yes yes | yes PRI
laute original size detection, etc X yos yes yes | yes yes yes | yes . s R
I_Pﬂons g . _— -
"audometic: duplexing 1 x ] ingb yes [ _ind incl yos | yes I
[reversing auto documenter feader - 50sheats | X : yes Il yes incl incl yes | yes L
no hole punch
finisher -stapling; 2 & 3 hole punch, 3000 sheet no hole punch | 3 hole punch 1000 sht no hole punch | no hole punch
capaciy ) X | ye3hole _1,844,00 $1,500.00 $2,361,00 $1,151.00 1,100sh | 2200shts | 2500 sheets $1,600.00 o
CODY mat. acet, codes X yos inel yas : yes yes yos ;
| Subtctel . T SZ0000]F 1091406 % 000000 i $ 867900 |[§  12,700.00 {§ 1508500 | §  10.017.00
5.C. Sales Tax (5%} _ § 4600008 54570 [ § 500.00 \ 3 433.96 | § 535.00 | § 699.75 | § 545.85
Total ] $ 066000($ 1145970 ' §  10,500.00 |§ . 911295 [$ 1333500 [§  146M75|% 1146285
State warranty o _ _ S0 days 30 days — i ] 90 days 90 days -
ICost of service agreement o B S . ) : -
| st ysar per copy 56,000 1 g 560.00 | § 560.00 | § 728.00 | 18 660008 560005 672.00 [$
2nd yeer per copy 58,000 | E 588.00 | § 588.00 | § 728.00 | 3 61600 |§  615.00 |3 74000 1§
3rd year per copy 56,000 . § 616.00 [ § 61600 ([$§ 72800 - 1 T Is " ere00]s  e7200i$ 81400 §
Total Cost for Sheriff $ 14240018 1327370 ([§ 12,684.00 K - 1% 10960.95(§ 1518300 |§ 1692075 | §
1st yeer par copy 76,000 1 76000 1% 760.00 [ § 988.00 1% 76000 % | ¢1200 | §
2nd yeat per copy 76,000 1 795.00 | § 798.00 | § 98800 | - " 1Is  m36.00] 3 100400 | $
ard year per copy 76,000 [ 836.00 836.00 | § 988.00 | B s 91200 | $  1,10500]%
| Total Cost for Communications IS 12054005 1385370 |8 13464008 - |8 - |§s 1162095 17,7575 [
[Delivery ARO __ 2wesks  |iDdays Wdays  |30days 10 working days days
L Jincomplete F‘ nol maat spece [1 GB hard drive
|Amount of Award [copler X 2) $ 1932000 | § / 22919.40 . % .21,000.00—1 | $ 1822590 % 2667000 |$ 2938950 | § 22,825.70

Atended Bid Cpening: Ann Albertson, Donna McAlister, Les Buford, Jamie Howard, Randy Smith



Decamber 16, 1998 Capiers - Digital Bid 99-09
| Quality Professional
Sheriff & Keames Konlca Businass  |Southem Office Office
Faature Comm, lkon Business Prod | Business Tech Offico Pro | Office Pro Pluz Inc Plus In¢ : Systems Systems Inc Products
: Royal Copystar
Brandend Model Ricoh 450 Mita Al 4040 Konica 7040 | Savin D945DP | Savin 99350P |  Konica 7040 Konica 7160 | Minoka D520 4000d nobid
Bags Bid for Copler |$ o920000(% 798500|% 690000|% 7409700'3% 6907005 8670003 1270000 |$ 1300500 |§  6,928.00
esltimated annual volume R 1 i - i ﬁ
icopler stend {console} ) yes  f fncl 3 1,200.00 | 3 110.00°] 110 o ye | %
copies per WK | B ] 45 _40 LS 3 0 . &2 _
computer interface capabilities - &s steted i in
MinimumSpecs X 0 __yes | yes $ 239000 % 2,390.00 yes __yes } $1,447.00 L
resciution 600 x 800 dpi - copy, scat, pAnt, gfay 400 - 600 400/800dpi 400/600dpl
scale 250 levels X 400 x 400 o yes selectable yes _yes seloctable selectable b o
mamory 32 MB upgradatie 1o 128 MB X yes _ yes 1610 80 inct yes 16MB-80MB._ | 16MB-128MB o B
document pROCESS0r ¢ 70 ; X . yes yes L e yes .. yes _yes yes 100 shoets
continyous copying up to 899, aute reset to 1 X yos 1 yes yes yes yes yes yes o
meximum copy size . X7 | yes | yes ) Yes yes | yes yes yes I S
minimum copy size o 55" X8, 5" o yes 1 yes yes yes _Yes yes yes o -
i of papar trays 3 yes 2-550 yes - 2-500 2-500 yes L] . B
capecity of peper trays 1-3000, 2-550) 1-1500,2-500 |  $1,085.00 yes | 2.500 $956.00 | 2.500$956.00 | 1-1500, 2-500 | 1-3000, 2500 | 73000 shests |§ 942.00
manual by-pess 100 sheet X yes - 50 yes _yes 50 . - yes yes
variable megniication 25-400%, o X yes _ Yyes _yes yes _yes L yes 33400% |
stackless duplexinguplo 989shests | X = |  yes .. yes yes _yes yes yes yoe e R -
digital effects to incl image reverse, imege
combingtion, imags rotation, image overlay,
booklet mode, rotate sort, miror image, pege
numbering, ekcironic sorting X 1 yes 1 . yes o yes yes _._Yes, _yes i _ __yes L S O R
ability to scan additional Jobe into memory ‘while
one job is running — X . L ye yes yes __Y¥es yes yes | R N .
book copy - . X _yes L yes _yes o yes 1 _yes yes .
photo copy - X | . yes _p  _ yes yes yes yes _yes .
amn@gllalszedetsdhnem X yes Yos _yas yes yes yos
Options . , w J R - Z
automatic duplexing X | yes indd | yes incl incl yes __yes .
reversing sulo documanter feeder - 60 sheets X _ yes inct yes incl incl yes yes 1 o
: no hole punch
finisher -stepling; 2 & 3 hale punch, 3000 shest I i no hole punch | 3 hole punch 1000 sht no hole punch | no hole punch
capacity | X __L zet 3 hole _1,844.00 $1,900.00 $2,361.00 $1,151.00 1,100 sht 2,200 shis 2500sheets | $160000 | o
copy mgt_acct codes X . incl yes [ yes yes yes
[ Sublota — Y 9'200 601§ 105400y 10,000.00 ! ¥ BE0.00 [§ _ 127000015 1395500 (% 10917.00
8. C. Sales Tax {5%) $ 460.00 | § 54570 | § 500.00 k] 433.95 | § 636.00 | § 699.75 | § 54585
| Total o $ 986000 |% 1145070 %  10,500.00 |§ - $  911205!5 13335003 14604755 1146285
Statewarranty - 9 days | | ‘ i 0days |
Cost of sorvice agresment o 1 L L
Istyear percopy 56,000 . § 56000 — $  67200]% §96.00 e
_2nd year per copy 56,000 $ 588.00 - E 74000 | § 896.00
3rd yesr per copy 56,000 5 61600 E 814.00 | § 896.00 |
TOtal Cost for Shariff . _ 11,424.00 1 - 3 16,9.’1‘0.7’%1 $ 1415085 | § -
st yeer percopy 76,000 _ § Teconly 7 § 91200 % .
" "2nd year per copy 76,000 3 788.00 5 100400 § 1.21
3rd year per copy 76,000 I - 3 N $. 110500
Tatel Cost for Communlcations e 5 12 054 00 |5 0. - . 8 17,7575 -
Delivery ARG . ..Ndays s M5days | . 12
e B B : _Incomplete | 11 GB hard drive |




" Bid 99:30

Wheel Loader for Rock Quarry January 6, 2000
Interstate Eq | Mitchell Dist Blanchard |A E Finley & S C Tractor | Pioneer | Road Mach Van Loft
Bidders Co Co L B Smith Inc| Mach Co Assoc Inc & EqCo |Machinc| Servinc | Inc
[Wheel loader - Base Bid $382,285.00 | $397,295.00 | $433,006.00 | $479,826.00 (no bid no bid no bid no bid J no bid
(sales tax exempt) - L S I N
3-yr powertrain $ 16,580.00 |$ 5705.00!% 900000
Total $398,865.00 | $ 403,000.00 | $ 442,006.00 | $478,826.00
Option 1: 3-yr Warranty $ 28,170.00 $ 21,200.00
Kaweasaki Komatsu
Model 115ZIV-2 WABQ0-3 Volvo L330D |Cat 988F
[
—
Delivery 120 days 10 - 12 weeks |45 to 60 days |2-6 weeks F ]
! 10 wks bucket
- | T
e _‘ —
Price increase ‘
3% 2-1-00 ]
—— _ I — L

Attended Bid Opening: Ann Albertson, Donna McAlister, Tommy Crumpton, Ray Brooks, Mark Dantzier, Jeff High, Olin Dorroh, Gehe Kendrick, Barry

Sullivan

L R R RTIEEEE—————EEEEEEEE——E——————————




(Use this number on envelopes and
all related correspondence.}

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
415 S, PINE ST., ROOM 107, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The INTERSTATE EQUTPMENT_COMPANY.
Submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in compliance
with the description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for an articulated wheel loader for
the Rock Quarry .

BASE BID o $_ 382,285.00*

ot

3 YEAR 5000 HR Powertrain  $16,580,00%

Option #1 — Three-year warranty $_3 YEAR BUMPER TO BUMPER $28,170.00%

* Prices to increase 37 after February 1, 2000

The above stated bid is based on all applicable specifications, drawings, etc. associated with this
bid and the following additional Addenda issued subsequent to the basic specifications and/or
drawings.

NOTE TO BIDDER: List all Addenda with dates of any issued. If no additional Addenda is
1ssued, write the word “NONE”.

(tax exempt — used for mining purposes)

Addendum Number Date

N/A

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice. Show any exception, deviation, extra
computation, or information on Bid Supplemental Form attached hereto.

CompletiOn/Delivery Date ARQ: 120 DAYS (IF EMERGENCY STEERING NOT REQUIRED - 45 DAYS
. . & DEDUCT $3925.00)
Bidding Organization: _ TNTERSTATE EQUIPMENT COMPANY.

Mailing Address: 122 GARDNERS TEW WEST CORUMBIA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29172
Signature of Bidder’s Representative:

Print Name of Bidder’s Representative: . MARK DANTZLER
Title: VICE PRESIDENT Date: JANUARY 5, 2000
Telephone:_ (803) 794-7400 Fax: _739-0869 (803) _

Bid Pkg Wheel Loader



S - BID SUPPLEMENTAL FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
. 415 S. PINE STREET, ROOM 107

WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

DATE: JANUARY 5, 2000 BIDNO 99-30
The INTERSTATE EQUIPMENT COMPANY takes the following exceptions:
(Bidder)

UNDER STANDARD EQUIPMENT

ALARMS AUDIBLE & VISUAL
THERE WILL BE NO BRAKE OIL LEVEL ALARMS AS THE BRAKE OIL IS THE SAME
AS THE HYDRAULIC OIL.

SIGNATURE:

Bid Pkg Wheel Loader

oo



BID NO, 99-30

{Use this number on envelopes and
all related correspondence.)

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
415 S. PINE ST., ROOM 107, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The _ Mirchell i strihuting Company
Submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in compliance
with the description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for an articulated wheel loader for
the Rock Quarry .

BASE BID . $ 397,295.00

(tax exempt - used for mining purposes)

Option #1 — Three-year warranty $ 5,705.00

The above stated bid is based on all applicable specifications, drawings, etc. associated with this
bid and the following additional Addenda issued subsequent to the basic specifications and/or
drawings.

NOTE TO BIDDER: List all Addenda with dates of any issued. If no additional Addenda is
1ssued, write the word “NONE”.

Addendum Number Date

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice. Show any exception, deviation, extra
computation, or information on Bid Supplemental Form attached hereto.

Completion/Delivery Date ARO:__10-12 weeks

Bidding Organization:_Mirchell Digtributine Company
Mailing Address: 407 Oak Road Road, Piedmont, SC
Signature of Bidder’s Representative: Q,g,.\ o 0017 0761
Print Name of Bidder’s Representative: 0111 Dorroh

Title:  Branch Manager Date: /- &~ 00

Telephone: __864-220-9482 Fax: _864-220-9489

Bid Pkg Wheel Loader



BID SUPPLEMENTAL FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
415 S. PINE STREET, ROOM 107

WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

DATE: /- &- 00

BIDNO 99-30

The Mitchell Distributing Company
(Bidder)
Bucket Linkage - Single "Z'" Bar

Optional 3 year warranty is Power Train only
Differential, Straight Bevel Gear

takes the following exceptions:

sonatore: (04 Lwn s

Olin Dorroh, Branch Manager

Bid Pkg Wheel Loader

Ub



BID NO. 99-30
(Use this nmnber on envelopes and
all related correspondence.)

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
415 S. PINE ST., ROOM 107, WALHALLA, SC 29651

The L.B, SMITH, INC.
Submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in compliance
with the description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for an articulated wheel loader for
the Rock Quarry .

ONE NEW VOLVO L330D
STANDARD WARRANTY-12 MONTHS OR 2500 HOURS COMPLETE

BASE BID . . $ 433,006.00
(tax exempt — used for mining purposes)

Option #1 — Three-year warranty $9,000.00 VOLVO CAP 6C (3 YEAR 6000
HOUR COMPONENTS PLAN)

The above stated bid is based on all applicable specifications, drawings, etc. associated with this

bid and the following additional Addenda issued subsequent to the basic specifications and/or

drawings.

NOTE TO BIDDER: List all Addenda with dates of any issued. If no additional Addenda is

issued, write the word “NONE”,

Addendum Number Date

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice, Show any exception, deviation, extra
computation, or information on Bid Supplemental Form attached hereto.

Cgmple‘tion/])elivery Date ARQ: 45 TO 60 DAYS ARO LOADER, ROCKLAND BUCKET 10 WEEKS.

Bidding Organization: L.B. SMITH, INC.
Mai]ing Address: P.O. BOX 1453 COLUMBIA SC 29202

Signature of Bidder’s Repr&senmﬁve:‘,%_%é‘/
Print Name of Bidder’s Representative: GENE KENDRICK

Title: TERRITORY MANAGER Date: 01-05-2000

Telephone: 1-800-541-5744 Fax: 1-803-791-9920

Bid Pkg Wheel Loader



BID SUPPLEMENTAL FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
415 S. PINE STREET, ROOM 107

WALHALLA, SOUTH CAROLINA 29691

DATE: 01-05-2000 BIDNO 99-30
The L.B. SMITH, INC. takes the following exceptions:
(Bidder) :

1) VOLVO USES A 4 SPEED FORWARD AND 4 SPEED REVERSE
AUTOMATIC COUNTERSHAFT TRANSMISSION.

2) VOLVO USES 4 VARIABLE DISPLACEMENT PISTON PUMPS.
THE MAXIMUM SYSTEM PRESSURE IS 3118PSI. THIS
SYSTEM ALLOWS FOR LOAD-SENSING HYDRAULICS AND
GREATLY REDUCED FUEL CONSUMPTION.

SIGNATURE: /;%w W

Bid Pkg Wheel Loader



(Use this number on envelopes and
' all related commespondence.)

BID FORM
OCONEE COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
415 S. PINE ST., ROOM 107, WALHALLA, SC 29691

The Blanchard Machinery Co
Submits herewith our Bid in response to bid request number shown above, and in comphanoe
with the description(s) and/or specification(s) attached hereto for an articulated wheel loader for
the Rock Quarry .

BASE BID . $ 479,826.00
(tax exempt — used for mining purposes)

Option #1 — Three-year warranty §$_ 21,200.00

The above stated bid is based on all applicable specifications, drawings, etc, associated with this
bid and the following additional Addenda issued subsequent to the basic specifications and/or
drawings.

NOTE TO BIDDER: List all Addenda with dates of any issued. If no additional Addenda is
issued, write the word “NONE”.

Addendum Number Date

— ——

Bid shall include delivery to location stated on Bid Notice. Show any exception, deviation, extra
computation, or information on Bid Supplemental Form attached hereto.

Completion/Delivery Date ARO: 2 - 6 weeks delivery

Bidding Organization: _ Blanchard Machinery Co.
Mailing Address: _ 224 Neely Ferrv Road, Simpsonville, S. C, 29680
Signature of Bidder’s Representative: %W WM

Print Name of Bidder’s Representative: Barr;iSullivan |

Title: sates Representatrive Date:_ Japuary 6, 2000

Telephone: (854) 9g3.3645 Fax: (864) 9632063

Bid Pkyg Wheet Loader



OCIﬂﬂHECOERﬂHKPUR£IUHHN(?DEPARINHMTI
415 S. PINE STREET, ROOM 107
‘l' VVAJJEAIJJ&EﬂJUTT!CAJUDLﬂQAZSG?I

BIDNO 9%9-36

DATE: ___January6,—2660

takes the following exceptions:

The Blanchard Machinery Ce-

(Bidder)

1. If you would like the STIC Control Option instead of the
steering wheel, it would cost $2,249.00 less.

2. We will honor the warranty specified at 3 years/7,500 hrs.
(whichever comes first). This will cover warranty situations,
defective parts and workmanship; not to include normal wear
and tear, G.E.T., tires, operator abuse or negligence,
adjustments or servicing.

To increase the full machine warranty to 5 years or 7,500 hrs.
exempting travel time and mileage from these extra 2 years
. Add $3,050.00

SIGNATURE: %’Mﬂﬁ/ ,m""

Bid Pig Wheel Losder



JANUARY 11, 2000

MEMORANDUM
TO: COUNCIL MEMBERS
FROM: OPAL

LISTED BELOW, PLEASE FIND ANTICIPATED EXPENDITURES FOR THE CENSUS
COMMITTEE:

ESTIMATED EXPENDITURES FOR CENSUS COMMITTEE:

BUMPER STICKERS: $ 495.00
SIGNS: $ 400.00
PAID ADVERTISEMENTS: $ 100.00

TOTAL: $ 995.00



A y ‘
r COUNCIL OF GOVERNMENTS

30 Century Circle » PO Drawer 6468
Greenville, SC 29606 » (8643 2429733

January 3, 2000

Mr. Harrison Orr, Supervisor
415 South Pine Street
Walhalla, SC 29691

Dear Hamison;

The terms of citizen and minority members appointed by the County Council to the
Appalachian Council of Governments’ Board expire in January of even-numbered years.
It is now time for Oconee County Council to appoint or re-appeint its citizen and
minority COG Board representatives for a two-year term, which will expire in January
2002. The names and addresses of the persons currently holding these positions are
shown below:

Citizen Member Minority Member

Robert Gaillard Vikki Allen

P. O. Drawer 188 1035 Highway 123 By-Pass
Walhalla, SC 29691 Seneca, SC 29678

Please Note: Over the past several years, a conflict has persisted between the councils of
governments in South Carolina and the Economic Development Administration (EDA)
relative to the selection and appointment of minority members to councils of
governments’ boards. The EDA requirement is actually in conflict with the COG
bylaws, which state that minority members will be appointed by the re

council.

The conflict will not arise if:

1)  County Council re-appoints the same minority member(s) as currently hold the
position(s); or

2)  New minority appointees are locally elected officials such as county or city council
members, school board members or other elected posts.

Providing Quality Services To Local Governments Since 1965.



Mr. Harrison Orr, Supervisor
Page 2
January 3, 2000

Please contact Bob Strother, the Council’s Executive Director, when your appointment is
finalized, or if you have questions. If possible, we would appreciate receiving the
appointment prior to January 31, 2000.

Best regards,

o

Bob Nash
Chairman

/gmm



OCONEE COUNTY COUNCIL

ORDINANCE 2000-02

BE IT ORDAINED, by Oconee County Council in Council duly assembled,
upon third and final reading:

SECTION I:

This Ordinance shall be known as “THE 199% - 2000 SUPPLEMENTAL
APPROPRIATIONS ORDINANCE FOR OCONEE COUNTY™:

SECTION II:

The purpose of this Ordinance is to amend and modify the 1999 - 2000
APPROPRIATIONS ORDINANCE FOR OCONEE COUNTY, Ordinance 99-5 and to
make appropriations, both supplemental and primary, from current revenue for the
remaining portion of fiscal year 1999-2000 and to transfer funds from department
accounts to other authorized uses as stated herein and to implement, approve and ratify
the policies and programs authorized by the Oconee County Council, and other matters
relating thereto.

SECTION III:

The modifications set forth on Exhibit A attached hereto are approved.

SECTION 1V:

Unless specifically modified, amended or deleted herein, all appropriations of
funds created by the “APPROPRIATIONS ORDINANCE FOR OCONEE COUNTY”
(Ordinance 99-5) are hereby ratified and shall remain in full force and effect as originally
adopted. All other sections of Ordinance 99-5 not modified, directly or by implication
shall likewise remain in full force and effect.

REVENUES: (See Ordinance 99-5, pages {1 — 16)

EXPENDITURES: (See Ordinance 99-5, pages 17 — 93
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QCONEE COUNTY, SOUTH CARCLINA
TENTATIVE SUPPLEMENTAL EXPENDITURE CHANGE RERORT

JANUARY, 2000

Actount Name
B840 CAP EXPEND EQUIP

Net for Department

408 PROCESS SERVER
M4 DEPUTY
428 DEPUTYI
457 CRIME SCENE TECH! EVIDENCE
458 CORPORAL
4121 TEMPORARY SALARY
13 SOCIAL SECURITY
14 RETIREMENT
15 WORKERS COMPENSATION
25 PROFESSICNAL

Net for Department

77715 SPEC DIST FOR WIC TO STAT
767 CONTINGENCY
7853 ENCUMBRANCE EXPENSE

Net for Department

BS0 CAP EXPEND BLDGS
10312 LIBRARY NRC 10 57 338
58 AUTHORITY CONTROL
3500 BGOKS
3507 AUDIO VISUAL

Net for Department

2008 AIRPORT VEHICLE MAINTENANCE

2011 ANIMAL CONTROL VEHICLE MAINTEMANCE
2017 ASSESSOR VEHICLE MAINTENANCE

2057 HEALTH DEPT VEMICLE MAINTENANCE

Net for Department

1600 DEPUTY SOLICITOR
1606 ASSISTANT SOUCTOR
13 SOCAL SECURITY
14 RETIREMENT
15 WORKERS COMPENSATION
41 TELEPHONE

Net for Department

1720 PROPERTY LISTER
1723 PROPERTY USTER
1724 PROPERTY LISTER
13 SOCIAL SECURITY
14 RETIREMENT
15 WORKERS COMPENSATION

Net for Department

1800 PRT DIRECTOR

1803 SECRETARY |
13 SOCIAL SECURITY
14 RETIREMENT
15 WORKERS COMPENSATION
22 MAINT BUILDINGS/GROUNDS
42 GAS & FUEL O
44 WATER/SEWER/GARBAGE
B1 SALES TAXTO 5C

Net for Department
56 DATA PROCESSING
Net for Department
2107 ACCQUNT CLERK #
13 SOCIAL SECURITY
14 RETIREMENT
15 WORKERS COMPENSATION

Maet for Depantment

SUPPLEMENTAL
Departmant REQUEST
Computer Tax Center 4.900.00
Computer Tax Center 4,900.00
Sheriffs Office -
Sheriff's Offica -
Sheriffs Office -
Sheriff's Office -
Sheriffs Office 3,466.40
Sheriffs Office -
Sheriff's Office -
Sheriffs Office .
Sheriffs Office 25,000.00
Sheritfs Office 2B,466,40
General Expense -
General Expense 42.250.00
General Expense {8,759.00)
General Expense 35,491.00
Library 200,000.00
Libyrary 3,655.00
Library 10,000.00
tibrary 9,006.00
Library 6,000.00
Library 228,661.00
Motor Poot 250000
Motor Poci 3.000.00
Maotor Peol 2,000,00
Moatar Pool 1,500.00
Motor Pool ,000.00
Solicitor -
Salicitor -
Solicitor -
Solicitor -
Selicitor -
Sallcitor 431.00
Solicitor 421.00
Assessor -
Assessor -
Assessor -
Assessor -
Assessor -
Assessor -
Asgsessor -
PRT -
PRT -
PRT -
PRT -
PRT -
PRT - Chau Ram Park 1,500.00
PRT - Chau Ram Park 250.00
PRT - Chau Ram Park 400.00
PRT - High Falls Park 1,600.00
PRT 3,750.00
Clerk of Court 8,703.21
Clork of Court 8,70321
Auditor 17.485.00
Auditor 1,338.00
Auditor 1,188.00
Auditor 88.00
Auditor 20,105.00

TENTATIVE

RECOMMENDATION NOTE

4,800.00
4,900.00

{12.000.00)
(5,000.00)
{5,000.00)
{7.000.00)
(8,000.00)

345640
{2,565.32)
(3.950.00)
{(2.31282)
25,000.00

{(17.371.74)

{300,000.00)
42,250.00
(6,759.00)

{284,508.00)

3,855.00
10,000.00
9,005.00
6.,000.00

28,861.00

2.500.00
3,000.00
2,000.00
1,5600.00

9,000.00

{5.000.00)
{7.000.00)
(918.00}
(622.00)
{80.00)
431.00

(13,350.00)

{5,000.00)
{5,000.00)
(5,000.00)
{1,147.50)
(1,027.50}

{420.00)

{17,695.00)

(29,113.00)
{6.000.00)
(2,686.14)
{2,405.24)
{1,755.65)

1,500.00
250.00
400,00

1,600.00

(38,210,04)
8,703.11
870321

- N
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GCONEE COUNTY, SOUTH CAROLINA
TENTATIVE SUPPLEMENTAL EXPENDITURE CHANGE REPORT

JANUARY, 2000
Account Name

2203 EXECUTIVE ASSISTANT
13 SOCIAL SECURITY
14 RETIREMENT
15 WORKERS COMPENSATION
18 TRAVEL QUT OF COUNTY
24 MAINT ON EQUIPMENT
32 OPERATIONAL
41 TELEFHONE
85 CLOTHING: UNIFORMS
84 SCHOOL/SEMINAR/TRARVMEET

850 CAP EXPEND BLDGS
22881 CAP EXP ROAD PAVING/BRIDG

Net for Department

25 PROFESSIONAL
32 OPERATIONAL
870 GAP EXPEND VEH EQUIPMENT

Net for Department

3117 COMMLUINICATIONS EQUIP MANG
13 SOCIAL SECURITY
14 REYTIREMENT
15 WORKERS COMPENSATION
84D CAP EXPEND EQU®

Net for Department

3604 BUDGET ANALYST
13 SOCIAL SECURITY
14 RETIREMENT
15 WORKERS COMPENSATION
B4 SCHOOLSEMINAR/TRAINMMEET

Net for Department

25 PROFESSIONAL
31 OFFICE EQUIPMENT
54881 CAP EXP BLASTING

Net for Department
31 OFFICE EQUIPMENT

Net for Department

5802 ECONOMIC DEV DIRECTOR

13 BOCIAL SECURITY

14 RETIREMENT

15 WORKERS COMPENSATION

18 TRAVEL

22 MAINT BUILDINGS/GROLINDS

B0 DUES: ORGANIPATIONS

84 SCHOOL/SEMINARITRAINMEET
5825 INDUSTRIAL RECRUTMENT EX

Nat for Department

31 OFFICE EQUSPMENT
31 OFFICE EQUIPMENT
41 TELEPHONE
41 TELEPHONE

Net for Department
7424 MEDICAL OFFICER
13 SOCIAL SECURITY

14 RETIREMENT
15 WORKERS COMPENSATION

Met for Departmant
TOTAL - ALL DEPARTMENTS

Department

Supervisor's Office
Supervisor's Office
Supervisor's Offica
Supervisor's Office
Supervisor's Office
Supenisors Office
Supervisor's Office
Supervisor's Office
Supenvisor's Office
Supervisor's Qffice
Supervisor's Office
Supervisor's Office

Supervisor's Office

Coroner
Coroner
Coroner

Coroner

Communications
Communications
GCommunications
Communications
Communications

Communications

Finance
Finance
Finance
Finance
Finance

Finance

Rock Quarry
Rock Quarry
Rock Quarmy

Rock Quany
Heaith Department
Health Depariment

Economic Deveicpment
Economic Development
Economic Development
Economic Development
Economic Development
Econoenic Development
Econcemic Development
Economic Development
Economic Development

Economic Development

Magisirate’s Office
Magistrate’s Office
Magistrate’s Office
Mapistrate’s Office

Magistrate's Office

Law Enforcement Center
Law Enforcernent Cetter
Law Enforcement Center
Law Enforcement Center

Law Enforcement Center

SUPPLEMENTAL
REQUEST

TENTATIVE
RECOMMENDATION NOTE

8,000.00
15,000.00
3,000.00
1.000,00
1,500.00
35,000.00
20,300.00

84,100.00

2,500.00
21,500.00
24,600.00

167,843.00
167,342.00

{6,000.00)
{459.00)
(411.00)

(30.00}
1,500.00

{3,400.00)

500.00
1,000.00
20,000.00

21,500.00
8,932.30
8,932.30

(13,223.00
(1,011.00)
(905.00)
{66.00)
4,580.00
550,00
120,00
1,800.00
1.500.00

{8,255.00}
192.00
250.00
100.00
240.00

782.00

638,513.91

(5,000.00)
(382.50
(342.50)
(25.00)
300.00
8,000.00
15,000.00
3,000.00
1,000.00
1,500.00
35,000.00

20,300.00

78,350.00

2.500.00
500.00
- 3

3,000.00

(9.000.00)
(688.50)
{G618.50)

{45.00)

(10,350.00)

(6.000.00)
(456.00)
(411.00)

{30.00)
1,500.00

{5,400.00)

500,60
1,000.00
20,000.00

21,600.00

(13.223.00)
(1011.00)
{905.00)
(66.00)
4,980.00
550.00
120.00
1,800.00
1,500.00

{8,255.00)
182.00
25000
100.00
240.00
782.00

{8.000.00)

(612.00)
(856.00)
(488.00)
(9,956.00)

(228,119.58)



OCONEE COUNTY, SOUTH CAROLINA
TENTATIVE SUPPLEMENTAL EXPENDITURE CHANGE REPORT

JANUARY, 2000
SUPPLEMENTAL TENTATIVE
Account Name Departmant REQUEST RECOMMENDATION NOTE
TOTAL - ALL DEPARTMENTS FROM PREVIOUS PAGE 6335131 (228,119.55)
NOTE1 EXPENDITURES TO BE FUNDED WITH GRANT FUNDS (28,661.00) {28,661.00)
NET ADDITIONAL! {REDUCED) EXPENDITURES €08,862.91 {256,780.56)
NOTE 2 These entries are made at xero, pending prioritization of Capital improvernent

needs by County Council. {$80,000 of Communications request is carryover of
1998-1999 balance which was omitted from original budget ordinance)

NOTE 3 These enirias presurmne that Council will transfer funds from contingency to
purchase vehicles at State sale,



STATE OF SOUTH CAROLINA
COUNTY OF OCONEE
RESOLUTION 2000-01

“IN OBSERVANCE OF BLACK HISTORY MONTH DURING FEBRUARY, 2000, THE
MEMBERS OF THE OCONEE COUNTY COUNCIL RECOGNIZE THE
OUTSTANDING CONTRIBUTIONS OF AFRICAN-AMERICANS THROUGHOUT THE
HISTORY OF OUR COUNTY, STATE AND NATION”

WHEREAS, it is important that we remind ourselves during Black History Month of the
histortcal and extraordinary contributions African-Americans have made to ensure that all
citizens of this great State and Nation have equal rights and justice; and

WHEREAS, African-Americans have been and continue to be selfless providers of
vision and guidance to our Christian communities, which have allowed many groups and
affiliations to work together for a better South Carolina; and

WHEREAS, the Oconee County Council is greatly pleased to have this opportunity to
publicly recognize the observance of Black History Month in Oconge County.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Oconee County Council, in session
duly assembled, with a quorum present and voting:

THAT IN OBSERVANCE OF BLACK HISTORY MONTH DURING FEBRUARY
2000, THE MEMBERS OF THE QCONEE COUNTY COUNCIL RECOGNIZE THE
OUTSTANDING CONTRIBUTIONS OF AFRICAN-AMERICANS THROUGHOUT THE
HISTORY OF OUR COUNTY, STATE AND NATION.

APPROVED AND ADOPTED on first and final reading this 18" day of January, 2000

by a vate of*

Yes No
Harrison E. Orr, Supervisor/Chairman Tim Q. Hall, District I
J. Harold Thomas, District II Harry R. Hamilton, District 11T
Ann H. Hughes, District IV Charles R. Timms, District V
Attest:

Opal O. Green, Council Clerk



